SooperKanoon - India's Premier Online Legal Search ( sooperkanoon.com)

Source : sooperkanoon.com/act/13326/

Finance Act, 1986

Chapter III - Direct Taxes Income-tax

In section 10 of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1987, -
(a) in clause (3), for the words "not being winnings from lotteries, to the extent such receipts do not exceed one
thousand rupees in the aggregate"”, the words "to the extent such receipts do not exceed five thousand rupees in the
aggregate" shall be substituted;

(b) in clause (13A), the brackets and words "(not exceeding four hundred rupees per month)" shall be omitted.
Section 4 - Amendment Of Section 16

In section 16 of the Income-tax Act, in clause (i), for the portion beginnin% with the words "a sum equal to" and ending
with the words "whichever is less", the following shall be substituted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1987, namely:-

"a sum equal to thirty per cent. of the salary or ten thousand rupees, whichever is less".
Section 5 - Amendment Of Section 23

In section 23 of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1987, -
(a) for sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely :-
"(2) where the property consists of -
(a) a house or part of a house in the occupation of the owner for the purposes of his own residence, -

(i) which is not actually let during any part of the Erevious year and no other benefit therefrom is derived by the
owner, the annual value of such house or part of the house shall be taken to be nil;

(ii) which is let during any part or parts of the previous year, that part of the annual value (annual value being
determined in the same manner as if the property had been let) which is proportionate to the period during
which the prOﬁerty is in the occupation of the owner for the purposes of his own residence, or, as the case may
be, where such property is let out parts, that portion of the annual value appropriate to any part which was
occuﬁied by the owner for his own residence, which is proportionate to the period during which such part is
wholly occupied by him for his own residence shall be deducted in determining the annual value.

Explanation : The deduction under this sub-clause shall be made irrespective of whether the period during
which the property or, as the case may be, part of the property was used for the residence of the owner precedes
or follows the period during which it is let;

(b) more than one house in the occupation of the owner for the purlgoses of his own residence, the provisions of
clause (a) shall apply only in respect of one of such houses, which the assessee may, at his option, specify in this
behalf;

(c) more than one house and such houses are in the occupation of the owner for the purposes of his own
residence, the annual value of the house or houses, other than the house in respect of which the assessee has
exercised an option under clause (b), shall be determined under sub-section (1) as if such house or houses had
been let.
Explanation : Where any such residential unit as is referred to in the second proviso to sub-section (1) is in the
occupation of the owner for the purposes of his own residence, nothing contained in that proviso shall apply in
computing the annual value of that residential unit.";

(b) sub-section (2A) shall be omitted,;

(c) for sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely :-

"(3) Where the property referred to in sub-section (2) consists of one residential house only and it cannot actually be
occupied by the owner by reason of the fact that owing to his emplo¥ment, business or profession carried on at any
other place, he has to reside at that other place in a building not belonging to him, the annual value of such house
shall be taken to be nil:

Provided that the following conditions are fulfilled, namely :-

(i) such house is not actually let, and

(ii) no other benefit therefrom is derived by the owner.".
Section 6 - Amendment Of Section 24

In section 24 of the Income-tax Act, for sub-section (2), the following sub-sections shall be substituted with effect from the
1st day of April, 1987, namely :-


https://sooperkanoon.com/act/13326

"(2) No deduction shall be allowed under sub-section (1) in respect of property of the nature referred to in sub-clause (i)
of clause (a) of sub-section (2), or sub-section (3), of section 23 :

Provided that nothing in this sub-section shall apply to the allowance of a deduction under clause (vi) of sub-section
(1) of an amount not exceeding five thousand rupees in respect of the property of the nature referred to in sub-
clause (i) of clause (a) of sub-section (2) of section 23.

(3) The total amount deductible under sub-section (1) in respect of property of the nature referred to in sub-clause (ii)
of clause (a) of sub-section (2) of section 23 shall not exceed the annual value of the property as determined under that

section.”
Section 7 - Amendment Of Section 32A

In section 32A of the Income-tax Act, -
(a) in sub-section (2), -

() in clause (c), for the figures, letters and words "1st day of April, 1988,", the figures, letters and words "1st day of
April, 1987," shall be substituted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1987;

(ii) in clause (2) of the Explanation, for sub-clauses (i) and (ii), the following sub-clauses shall be substituted and
shall be deemed to have been substituted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1985, namely :-

"(1) in a case where the previous year ends before the 1st day of August, 1980, ten lakh rupees;

(ii) in a case where the grevious year ends after the 31st day of July, 1980 but before the 18th day of March, 1985,
twenty lakh rupees; an

(iii) in a case where the previous year ends after the 17th day of March, 1985, thirty-five lakh rupees,";

(b) in gub-section (8), the words ", not being earlier than three years from the date of such notification," shall be
omitted;

(c) after sub-section (84A), the following sub-section shall be inserted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1987, namely

"(8B) Subject to the provisions of clause (ii) of sub-section (3), no deduction shall be allowed under this section in the
case of an assessee who has claimed the deduction allowable under section 32AB.".

Section 8 - Insertion Of New Section 32AB

After fection 32A of the Income-tax Act, the following section shall be inserted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1987,
namely :-

'32AB. Investment deposit account. - (1) Subject to the other provisions of this section, where an assessee, whose total
income includes income chargeable to tax under the head "Profits and gains of business or profession”, has, out of such

income, -

(a) deposited any amount in an account (hereafter in this section referred to as deposit account) maintained by him
with the Development Bank before the expiry of six months from the end of the previous year or before furnishing
the return of his income, whichever is earlier; or

(b) utilised any amount during the previous year for the purchase of any new ship, new aircraft, new machinery or
plant, without depositing any amount in the deposit account under clause (a),

in accordance with, and for the purposes specified in, a scheme (hereafter in this section referred to as the scheme) to
be framed by the Central Government, or if the assessee is carrying on the business of growing and manufacturing tea
in India, to be approved in this behalf by the Tea Board, the assessee shall be allowed a deduction of -

(i) a sum equal to the amount, or the aggregate of the amounts, so deposited and any amount so utilised; or

(i) a sum equal to twenty per cent. of the profits of eli%ible business or profession as computed in the accounts of
the assessee audited in accordance with sub-section (5),

whichever is less.
(2) For the purposes of this section, -
(i) "eligible business or profession" shall mean business or profession, other than -

(a) the business of construction, manufacture or production of any article or thing specified in the list in the
Eleventh Schedule carried on by an industrial undertaking, which is not a small-scale industrial undertaking as
defined in section SOHHA;

(b) the business of leasing or hiring of machinery or plant to an industrial undertaking, other than a small-scale
industrial undertaking as defined in section 80HHA, engaged in the business of construction, manufacture or
production of any article or thing specified in the list in the Eleventh Schedule.

(ii) "new ship" or "new aircraft" or "new machinery or plant” shall have the same meanings as in the Explanation to
clause (vi) of sub-section (1) of section 32.

(3) The profits of eligible business or profession of an assessee for the purposes of sub-section (1) shall, -

(a) in a case where separate accounts in respect of such eligible business or profession are maintained, be an amount
arrived at after deducting an amount equal to the depreciation computed in accordance with the provisions of sub-



section (1) of section 32 from the amounts of profits computed in accordance with the requirements of Parts IT and III
of the Sixth Schedule to the Companies Act, 1956 (1 of 1956) as increased by an amount equal to the depreciation, if
any, debited in the audited profit and loss account; and

(b) in a case where such separate accounts are not maintained or are not available, be such amount which bears to the
total profits of the business or profession of the assessee after allowing depreciation in accordance with the provisions
of sub-section (1) of section 32, the same proportion as the total sales, turnover or gross receipts of the eligible business
or profession bear to the total sales, turnover or gross receipts of the business or profession carried on by the assessee.

(4) No deduction under sub-section (1) shall be allowed in respect of any amount utilised for the purchase of, -

(a) any machinery or plant to be installed in any office premises or residential accommodation, including any
accommodation in the nature of a guest house;

(b) any office appliances (not being computers);
(c) any road transport vehicles;

(d) any machinery or plant, the whole of the actual cost of which is allowed as a deduction (Whether by way of
depreciation or otherwise) in computing the income chargeable under the head "Profits and gains of business or
profession” of any one previous year.

(5) The deduction under sub-section (1) shall not be admissible unless the accounts of the business or profession of the
assessee for the previous year relevant to the assessment year for which the deduction is claimed have been audited by an
accountant as defined in the Explanation below sub-section (2) of section 288 and the assessee furnishes, along with his
return of income, the report of such audit in the prescribed form duly signed and verified by such accountant :

Provided that in a case where the assessee is required by or under any other law to get his accounts audited, it shall be

sufficient compliance with the provisions of this sub-section if such assessee gets the accounts of such business or
rofession audited under such law and furnishes the report of the audit as required under such other law and a
urther report in the form prescribed under this sub-section.

(6) Where any amount, standing to the credit of the assessee in the deposit account, released during any previous year by
the Development Bank for being utilised by the assessee for the purposes specified in the scheme or at the closure of the
account, is not utilised in accordance with the scheme, either wholly or in part, within that previous year, the whole of
such amount or, as the case may be, part thereof which is not so utilised shall be deemed to be the profits and gains of
business or profession of that previous year and shall accordingly be chargeable to income-tax as the income of that
previous year.

(7) Where any asset acquired in accordance with the scheme is sold or otherwise transferred in any previous year by the
assessee to any person at any time before the expir?r of eight years from the end of the previous year in which it was
ac%uired, such part of the cost of such asset as is relatable to the deductions allowed under sub-section (1) shall be deemed
to be the profits and gains of business or profession of the previous year in which the asset is sold or otherwise
transferred and shall accordingly be chargeable to income-tax as the income of that previous year :

Provided that nothing in this sub-section shall apply -
(i) where the asset is sold or otherwise transferred bY the assessee to Government, a local authority, a corporation
established by or under a Central, State or Provincial Act or a Government company as defined in section 617 of the
Companies Act, 1956 (1 of 1956); or
(ii) where the sale or transfer of the asset is made in connection with the succession of a firm by a company in the
business or profession carried on by the firm as a result of which the firm sells or otherwise transfers to the
company any asset and the scheme continues to apply to the company in the manner applicable to the firm.
Explanation : The provisions of clause (ii) of the proviso shall apply only where -

(1) all the properties of the firm relating to the business or profession immediately before the succession become the
properties of the company;

(ii) all the liabilities of the firm relating to the business or profession immediately before the succession become the
liabilities of the company; and

(iii) all the shareholders of the company were partners of the firm immediately before the succession.

(8) The Central Government may, if it considers it necessary or expedient so to do, by notification in the Official Gazette,
omit any article or thing from the list of articles or things specified in the Eleventh Schedule.

(9) The Central Government may, after makin§ such inquiry as it may think fit, direct, by notification in the Official
Gazette, that the provisions of this section shall not apply to any class of assessees, with effect from such date as it may
specify in the notification.

(10) No deduction shall be allowed under this section in the case of an assessee who has claimed the deduction allowable
under section 33AB.

Explanation : In this section, -
(a) "computers" does not include calculating machines and calculating devices;
(b) "Development Bank" means -
(1) in the case of an assessee carrying on business of growing and manufacturing tea in India, the National Bank for
Agriculture and Rural Development established under section 3 of the National Bank for Agriculture and Rural
Development Act, 1981 (61 of 1981);
(i) in the case of other assessees, the Industrial Development Bank of India established under the Industrial

Development Bank of India Act, 1964 (18 of 1964), and includes such bank or institution as may be specified in the
scheme in this behalf.".



Section 9 - Amendment Of Section 43
In section 43 of the Income-tax Act, in clause (1) after Explanation 7, the following Explanation shall be inserted and shall
be deemed to have been inserted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1974, namely :-
"Explanation 8 : For the removal of doubts, it is herebz declared that where any amount is paid or is payable as interest
in connection with the acquisition of an asset, so much of such amount as is relatable to any period after such asset is

first put to use shall not be included, and shall be deemed never to have been included, in the actual cost of such
asset.".

Section 10 - Amendment Of Section 50

In section 50 of the Income-tax Act, in clause (2), for the figures, letters and words "1st day of January, 1964", the figures,
letters and words "1st day of April, 1974" shall be substituted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1987.

Section 11 - Amendment Of Section 54

In section 54 of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1987, -

(a) in sub-section (1), for the words "one year before or after the date on which the transfer took place purchased", the
words "one year before or two years after the date on which the transfer took place purchased" shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-section (2), for the words "one year before or after the date of receipt of the additional compensation
purchased”, the words "one gear before or two years after the date of receipt of the additional compensation
purchased" shall be substituted.

Section 12 - Amendment Of Section 54E

In section 54E of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1), in Explanation 1, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1987, -

(a) in clause (c), after the words, figures and letters "after the 28th day of February, 1983", the words, figures and letters
"but before the 1st day of April, 1986" shall be inserted;

(b) after clause (c) as so amended, the following clause shall be inserted, namely :-

'(d) in a case where the original asset is transferred after the 31st day of March, 1986, any of the assets specified in
clause (c) and such bonds issued by any ?ublic sector company, as the Central Government may, by notification in
the Official Gazette, specify in this behalf.

Explanation : For the purposes of this clause, "public sector comPany" means any corporation established by or under any
Central, State or Provincial Act or a Government company as defined in section 617 of the Companies Act, 1956 (1 of
1956).".

Section 13 - Amendment Of Section 55

In section 55 of the Income-tax Act, for the figures, letters and words "1st day of January, 1964", wherever they occur, the
figures, letters and words "1st day of April, 1974" shall be substituted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1987.

Section 14 - Amendment Of Section 58
In section 58 of the Income-tax Act, after sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be inserted with effect from the 1st
day of April, 1987, namely :-
'(4) In the case of an assessee having income chargeable under the head "Income from other sources", no deduction in
respect of any expenditure or allowance in connection with such income shall be allowed under any provision of this
Act in computing the income by way of any winnings from lotteries, crossword puzzles, races including horse races,
card games and other games of any sort or from gambling or betting of any form or nature, whatsoever :

Provided that nothing contained in this sub-section shall apply in comﬁuting the income of an assessee, being the
owner of horses maintained by him for running in horse races, from the activity of owning and maintaining such
horses.
Explanation : For the purposes of this sub-section, "horse race" means a horse race upon which wagering or betting may
be lawfully made.".
Section 15 - Amendment Of Section 74

In section 74 of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1), in the proviso to clause (a), for the words "five thousand rupees", the
words "ten thousand rupees" shall be substituted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1987.

Section 16 - Amendment Of Section 74A

In section 74A of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1987, -

(a) sub-sections (1) and (2) shall be omitted;



(b) in sub-section (3), -
(1) in the opening portion, -
(A) the words "Where for any assessment year," shall be omitted;

(B) for the gortion beginning with the words "the net result of the computation” and ending with the words
"owning and maintaining race horses", the following shall be substituted, namely :-

"the amount of loss incurred by the assessee in the activity of owning and maintaining race horses in any
assessment year shall not be set off against income, if any, from any source other than the activity of owning and
maintaining race horses in that year and";
(ii) in clause (a), for the words, brackets, letter and figure "from the source specified in clause (c) of sub-section (2)",
the words "from the activity of owning and maintaining race horses," shall be substituted.
Section 17 - Amendment Of Section 80GG

In section 80GG of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1987, -

(a) for the words "to the extent to which such excess expenditure does not exceed four hundred rupees per month or
fifteen per cent. of his total income for the year, whichever is less", the words "to the extent to which such excess
expenditure does not exceed one thousand rupees per month or twenty-five per cent. of his total income for the year,
whichever is less" shall be substituted;

(b) in the proviso, in clause (ii), for the words, brackets and figures "under clause (i) or, as the case may be, clause (ii) of
sub-section (2)", the words, brackets, figures and letters "under sub-clause (i) of clause (a) or, as the case may be, clause
(b), of sub-section (2)" shall be substituted;

(c) in the Explanation, for the words "fifteen per cent.", at both the places where they occur, the words "twenty-five per
cent." shall be substituted.

Section 18 - Amendment Of Section SOHHA

In section 80HHA of the Income-tax Act, in clause (b) of the Explanation below sub-section (8), for sub-clauses (1) and (2),
the following sub-clauses shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted with effect from the 1st day of
April, 1985, namely :-

"(1) in a case where the previous year ends before the 1st day of August, 1980, ten lakh rupees;

(2) in a case where the previous year ends after the 31st day of July, 1980 but before the 18th day of March, 1985,
twenty lakh rupees; and

(3) in a case where the previous year ends after the 17th day of March, 1985, thirty-five lakh rupees.".
Section 19 - Omission Of Section 80K
Section 80K of the Income-tax Act shall be omitted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1987.
Section 20 - Amendment Of Section 80L

In section 80L of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1987, -
(a) in sub-section (1), for clause (ii), the following clause shall be substituted, namely :-

'(ii) interest on such debentures, issued by any institution or authority, or any public sector company, or any co-
operative society (including a co-operative land mortgage bank or a co-operative land development bank), as the
Central Government may, by notification in the Official Gazette, specify in this behalf.
Explanation : For the purposes of this clause, "public sector company” means any corporation established by or
under any Ce?tral, State or Provincial Act or a Government company as defined in section 617 of the Companies
Act, 1956 (1 of 1956);';

(b) sub-section (2) shall be omitted.
Section 21 - Substitution Of New Section For Section 80M

For sectionISOM of the Income-tax Act, the following section shall be substituted, with effect from the 1st day of April,
1987, namely :-

"80M. Deduction in respect of certain inter-corporate dividends. - Where the gross total income of an assessee, being a
domestic company, includes any income by way of dividends from a domestic company, there shall be allowed, in

computing the total income of the assessee, a deduction from such income by way of dividends of an amount equal to
sixty per cent. of such income.".

Section 22 - Omission Of Section 80S

Section 80S of the Income-tax Act shall be omitted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1987.



Section 23 - Amendment Of Section 80T

In section 80T of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1987, -
(1) for the words "five thousand rupees", wherever they occur, the words "ten thousand rupees"” shall be substituted;

(i) in clause (b), for the portion beginning with the words "in any other case, five thousand rupees" and ending with
the words "capital assets exceed five thousand rupees", the following shall be substituted, namely :-

"In any other case, ten thousand rupees as increased by a sum equal to -

(A) fifty per cent. of the amount by which the long-term capital gains relating to capital assets, being buildings or
lands or any rights in buildings or lands, or gold, bullion or jewellery exceed ten thousand rupees;

(B) sixty per cent. of the amount by which the long-term capital gains relating to any other capital assets exceed
ten thousand rupees".

(iii) the second proviso shall be omitted.
Section 24 - Omission Of Section 80TT
Section 80TT of the Income-tax Act shall be omitted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1987.
Section 25 - Amendment Of Section 115A

In section 115A of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1), with effect from the 1st day of April, 1987, -
(a) for clause (ii), the following clause shall be substituted, namely :-

"(ii) the amount of income-tax calculated on the income by way of royalty, if any, included in the total income, at the
rate of thirty per cent.;";

(b) in clause (iii), for the words "forty per cent.”, the words "thirty per cent." shall be substituted.
Section 26 - Insertion Of New Section 115BB

In Chapter XII of the Income-tax Act, after section 115B, the following section shall be inserted with effect from the 1st day
of April, 1987, namely :-

'115BB. Tax on winnings from lotteries, crossword puzzles, races including horse races, card games and other games of
any sort or gambling or betting of any form or nature whatsoever. - Where the total income of an assessee includes any
income by way of winnings from any lottery or crossword puzzle or race including horse race (not being income from
the activity of owning and maintaining race horses) or card game and other game of any sort or from gambling or
betting of any form or nature whatsoever, the income-tax payable shall be the aggregate of -

(1) the amount of income-tax calculated on income by way of winnings from such lottery or crossword puzzle or
race including horse race or card game and other game of any sort or from gambling or betting of any form or
nature whatsoever, at the rate of forty per cent.; and

(ii) the amount of income-tax with which the assessee would have been chargeable had his total income been
reduced by the amount of income referred to in clause ().

Explanation : For the purposes of this section, "horse race" shall have the same meaning as in section 74A.".
Section 27 - Insertion Of New Section 133B

In the Income-tax Act, after section 1334, the following section shall be inserted, namely :-

'133B. Power to collect certain information. - (1) Notwithstanding anything contained in any other provision of this Act,
an income-tax authority may, for the purpose of collecting any information which may be useful for, or relevant to, the
purposes of this Act, enter -

(a) any building or place within the limits of the area assigned to such authority, or
(b) any building or place occupied by any person in respect of whom he exercises jurisdiction,

at which a business or profession is carried on, whether such place be the principal place or not of such business or
profession, and require any proprietor, employee or any other person who may at that time and place be attending in
any manner to, or helping in, the carrying on of such business or profession to furnish such information as may be
prescribed.

(2) An Income-tax authority may enter any place of business or profession referred to in sub-section (1) only during the
hours at which such place is open for the conduct of business or profession.

(3) For the removal of doubts, it is hereby declared that an Income-tax authority acting under this section shall, on no
account, remove or cause to be removed from the building or place wherein he has entered any books of account or
other documents or any cash, sk or other valuable article or thing.

Explanation: In this section, "Income-tax authority" means an Inspecting Assistant Commissioner, an Assistant Director of
Inspection or an Income-tax Officer, and includes an Inspector of income-tax who has been authorised by the Income-tax



Officer to exercise the powers conferred under this section in relation to the area in respect of which the Income-tax
Officer exercises jurisdiction or part thereof.".

Section 28 - Amendment Of Section 155

In section 155 of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1987, -

(a) in sub-section (8), for the words "within a period of one year after the date of the transfer”, the words "within a
period of two years after the date of the transfer"” shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-section (8A), for the words "within a period of one year after the date of receipt”, the words "within a period
of two years after the date of receipt"” shall be substituted.

Section 29 - Amendment Of Section 193

In section 193 of the Income-tax Act, in the proviso, for clause (iib), the following clause shall be substituted with effect
from the 1st day of June, 1986, namely :-

'(iib) any interest payable on such debentures, issued by any institution or authority, or any public sector company, or
any co-operative society (including a co-operative land mortgage bank or a co-operative land development bank), as
the Central Government may, by notification in the Official Gazette, specify in this behalf.

Explanation: For the purposes of this clause, "public sector company" means any corporation established by or under

a?y Central, State or Provincial Act or a Government company as defined in section 617 of the Companies Act, 1956 (1
of 1956); or'.

Section 30 - Amendment Of Section 194B

In section 194B of the Income-tax Act, for the words "one thousand rupees", the words "five thousand rupees" shall be
substituted with effect from the 1st day of June, 1986.

Section 31 - Amendment Of Section 194BB

In section 194BB of the Income-tax Act, for the words "two thousand five hundred rupees"”, the words "five thousand
rupees"” shall be substituted with effect from the 1st day of June, 1986.

Section 32 - Amendment Of Section 204

In section 204 of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of June, 1986, -
(a) after clause (ii), the following clause shall be inserted, namely :-
"(iia) in the case of any sum payable to a non-resident Indian, being any sum representing consideration for the
transfer by him of any foreign exchange asset, which is not a short-term capital asset, the authorised dealer
responsible for remitting such sum to the non-resident Indian or for crediting such sum to his Non-resident
(External) Account maintained in accordance with the Foreign Exchange Regulation Act, 1973 (46 of 1973) and any
rules made thereunder;";
(b) the following Explanation shall be added at the end, namely :-
'Explanation: For the purposes of this section, -
(a) "non-resident Indian" and "foreign exchange asset" shall have the meanings assigned to them in Chapter XII-A;

(b) "authorised dealer" shall have the meaning assigned to it in clause (b) of section 2 of the Foreign Exchange
Regulation Act, 1973 (46 of 1973).".

Section 33 - Insertion Of New Section 269RR

In the Income-tax Act, after section 269R, the following section shall be inserted with effect from the 1st day of October,
1986, namely :-

"269RR. Chapter not to apply where transfer of immovable property made after a certain date. - The provisions of this
Chapter shall not apply to or in relation to the transfer of any immovable property made after the 30th day of
September, 1986.".

Section 34 - Insertion Of New Chapter XXC
In the Income-tax Act, after Chapter XXB, the following Chapter shall be inserted, namely :-

CHAPTER XXC

Purchase By Central Government Of Immovable Properties In Certain Cases Of Transfer

269U. Commencement of Chapter.--



The provisions of this Chapter shall come into force on such date as the Central Government may, by notification in
the Official Gazette, appoint, and different dates may be appointed for different areas.

269UA. Definitions.--
In this Chapter, unless the context otherwise requires, -

(a) "agreement for transfer" means an agreement, whether registered under the Registration Act, 1908 (16 of
1908) or not, for the transfer of any immovable property;

(b) "apparent consideration", -

(1) in relation to any immovable property in respect of which an agreement for transfer is made, being
immovable property of the nature referred to in sub-clause (i) of clause (d), means, -

(i) if the immovable property is to be transferred by way of sale, the consideration for such transfer as specified
in the agreement for transfer;

(ii) if the immovable property is to be transferred by way of exchange, -

(A) in a case where the consideration for the transfer consists of a thing or things only, the price that such thing
or things would ordinarily fetch on sale in the open market on the date on which the agreement for transfer is
made;

(B) in a case where the consideration for the transfer consists of a thing or things and a sum of money, the
agﬁ;regate of the price that such thing or things would ordinarily fetch on sale in the open market on the date on
which the agreement for transfer is made, and such sum;

(iii) if the immovable property is to be transferred by way of lease, -

(A) in a case where the consideration for the transfer consists of premium only, the amount of premium as
specified in the agreement for transfer;

(B) in a case where the consideration for the transfer consists of rent only, the aggregate of the moneys (if any)
payable by way of rent and the amounts for the service or things forming part of or constituting the rent, as
specified in the agreement for transfer;

(C) in a case where the consideration for the transfer consists of premium and rent, the aggregate of the amount
of the premium, the moneys (if any) payable by way of rent and the amounts for the service or things forming
part of or constituting the rent, as specified in the agreement for transfer,

and where the whole or any part of the consideration for such transfer is payable on any date or dates falling
after the date of such agreement for transfer, the value of the consideration payable after such date shall be
deemed to be the discounted value of such consideration, as on the date of such agreement for transfer,
determined by adopting such rate of interest as may be prescribed in this behalf;

(2) in relation to any immovable property in respect of which an agreement for transfer is made, being
immovable property of the nature referred to in sub-clause (ii) of clause (d), means, -

(1) in a case where the consideration for the transfer consists of a sum of money only, such sum;

(ii) in a case where the consideration for the transfer consists of a thing or things only, the price that such thing
or things would ordinarily fetch on sale in the open market on the date on which the agreement for transfer is
made;

(iii) in a case where the consideration for the transfer consists of a thing or things and a sum of money, the
agﬁ;regate of the price that such thing or things would ordinarily fetch on sale in the open market on the date on
which the agreement for transfer is made, and such sum,

and where the whole or any part of the consideration for such transfer is payable on any date or dates falling
after the date of such agreement for transfer, the value of the consideration payable after such date shall be
deemed to be the discounted value of such consideration, as on the date of such agreement for transfer,
determined by adopting such rate of interest as may be prescribed in this behalf;

(c) "appropriate authority” means an authority constituted under section 269UB to perform the functions of an
appropriate authority under this Chapter;

(d) "immovable property" means -

(i) any land or any building or part of a building, and includes, where any land or any building or part of a
building is to be transferred together with any machinery, plant, furniture, fittings or other things, such
machinery, plant, furniture, fittings or other things also.

Explanation : For the purposes of this sub-clause, "land, building, part of a building, machinery, plant, furniture,
fittings and other things" include any rights therein;

(i) any rights in or with respect to any land or any building or a part of a building (whether or not including any
machinery, plant, furniture, fittings or other things therein) which has been constructed or which is to be
constructed, accruing or arising from any transaction (whether by way of becoming a member of, or acquiring
shares in, a co-operative society, company or other association of persons or by way of any agreement or any
arrangement of whatever nature), not being a transaction by way of sale, exchange or lease of such land,
building or part of a building;

(e) "person interested", in relation to any immovable property includes all persons claiming, or entitled to claim,
an interest in the consideration payable on account of the vesting of that property in the Central Government
under this Chapter;

@ "transfer", -



(i) in relation to angf immovable property referred to in sub-clause (i) of clause (d), means transfer of such
property by way of sale or exchange or Iease for a term of not less than twelve years, and includes allowing the
possession of such property to be taken or retained in part performance of a contract of the nature referred to in
section 53A of the Transfer of Property Act, 1882 (4 of 1882).

Explanation : For the purposes of this sub-clause, a lease which provides for the extension of the term thereof by
a further term or terms shall be deemed to be a lease for a term of not less than twelve years, if the aggregate of
the term for which such lease is to be granted and the further term or terms for which it can be so extended is
not less than twelve years;

(ii) in relation to any immovable property of the nature referred to in sub-clause (ii) of clause (d), means the
doing of anything (Whether by way of admitting as a member of or by way of transfer of shares in a co-operative
society or company or other association of persons or by way of any agreement or arrangement or in any other
manner whatsoever) which has the effect of transferring or enabling the enjoyment of, such property.

269UB. Appropriate authority.—-
(1) The Central Government may, by order, published in the Official Gazette, -

(a) constitute as many appropriate authorities, as it thinks fit, to perform the functions of an appropriate
authority under this Chapter; and

(lil) define the local limits within which the appropriate authorities shall perform their functions under this
Chapter.

(2) An appropriate authority shall consist of three persons, two of whom shall be members of the Indian Income-tax

Service, Group A, holding the post of Commissioner of Income-tax or any equivalent or higher post, and one shall be

?1 m}(lember of the Central Engineering Service, Group A, holding the post of Chief Engineer or any equivalent or
igher post.

(3) In respect of any function to be performed by an appropriate authority under any provision of this Chapter in
rﬁlal'iion to any immovable property referred to in section 269UC, the appropriate authority referred to therein
shall, -

(a) in a case where such property is situate within the local limits of the jurisdiction of only one appropriate
authority, be such appropriate authority;

(b) in a case where such property is situate within the local limits of the jurisdiction of two or more appropriate
authorities, be the appropriate authority empowered to perform such functions in relation to such property in
accordance with the rules made in this behalf by the Board under section 295.

Explanation : For the purposes of this sub-section, immovable property being rights of the nature referred to in sub-
clause (ii) of clause (d) or section 269UA in, or with respect to, any land or any building or part of a building which
has been constructed or which is to be constructed shall be deemed to be situate at the place where the land is
situate or, as the case may be, where the building has been constructed or is to be constructed.

269UC. Restrictions on transfer of immovable property.—-

(1) Notwithstanding anything contained in the Transfer of Property Act, 1882 (4 of 1882), or in any other law for the
time being in force, no transfer of any immovable property of such value exceeding five lakh rupees as may be
prescribed, shall be effected except after an agreement for transfer is entered into between the person who intends
transferring the immovable l;l)ropert (hereinafter referred to as the transferor) and the person to whom it is
proposed to be transferred (hereinafter referred to as the transferee) in accordance with the provisions of sub-
section (2) at least three months before the intended date of transfer.

(2) The agreement referred to in sub-section (1) shall be reduced to writing in the form of a statement by each of the
parties to such transfer or by any of the parties to such transfer acting on behalf of himself and on behalf of the
other parties.
(3) Every statement referred to in sub-section (2) shall, -
(i) be in the prescribed form;
(ii) set for such particulars as may be prescribed; and
(iii) be verified in the prescribed manner,
and shall be furnished to the appropriate authority in such manner and within such time as may be prescribed, by
each of the parties to such transaction or by any of the parties to such transaction acting on behalf of himself and on
behalf of the other parties.
269UD. Order by appropriate authority for purchase by Central Government of immovable property.--
(1) The appropriate authority, after the receipt of the statement under sub-section (3) of section 269UC in respect of
any immovable propertg, may, notwithstanding anything contained in any other law or any instrument or any
agreement for the time being in force, and for reasons to be recorded in writing, make an order for the purchase by
the Central Government of such immovable property at an amount equal to the amount of apparent consideration :
Provided that no such order shall be made in respect of any immovable property after the expiration of a Period
of two months from the end of the month in which the statement referred to in section 269UC in respect of such
property is received by the appropriate authority :

Provided further that in a case where the statement referred to in section 269UC in respect of the immovable



property concerned is given to an appropriate authority, other than the appropriate authority having
jurisdiction in accordance with the provisions of section 269UB to make the order referred to in this sub-section
1n relation to the immovable propertK concerned, the period of limitation referred to in the preceding proviso
shall be reckoned with reference to the date of receipt of the statement by the appropriate authority having
jurisdiction to make the order under this sub-section.

(2) The appropriate authority shall cause a copy of its order under sub-section (1) in respect of any immovable
property to be served on the transferor, the person in occupation of the immovable property if the transferor is not
In occupation thereof, the transferee, and on every other person whom the appropriate authority knows to be
interested in the property.

269UE. Vesting of properly in Central Government.--

(1) Where an order under sub-section (1) of section 269UD is made by the appropriate authority in respect of an
immovable property referred to in sub-clause (i) of clause (d) of section 269UA, such property shall, on the date of
such order, vest in the Central Government free from all encumbrances.

(2) The transferor or any other person who may be in possession of the immovable property in respect of which an
order under sub-section (1) of section 269UD is made, shall surrender or deliver possession thereof to the
appropriate authority or any other person duly authorised by the appropriate authority in this behalf within fifteen
days of the service of such order on him.

3 If ang plerson refuses or fails to comply with the provisions of sub-section (2), the appropriate authority or other
person duly authorised by it under that sub-section may take possession of the immovable property and may, for
that purpose, use such force as may be necessary.

(4) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (2), the appropriate authority may, for the purpose of taking
possession of any property referred to in sub-section (1), requisition the services of any police officer to assist him
and it shall be the duty of such officer to comply with such requisition.

(5) For the removal of doubts, it is hereby declared that nothing in this section shall operate to discharge the
transferor or any other person (not being the Central Government) from liability in respect of any encumbrances on
the property and, notwithstanding anything contained in any other law for the time being in force, such liability
may be enforced against the transferor or such other person.

(6) Where an order under sub-section (1) of section 296UD is made in respect of an immovable property, being
rights of the nature referred to in sub-clause (ii) of clause (d) of section 269UA, such order shall have the effect of -

(a) vesting such right in the Central Government; and

(b) placing the Central Government in the same position in relation to such rights as the person in whom such a
right would have continued to vest if such order had not been made.

(7) Where any rights in respect of any immovable property, being rights in, or with re?ect to, any land or an
building or part of a building which has been constructed or which 1s to be constructed have been vested in the
Central Government under sub-section (6), the provisions of sub-sections (1), (2), (3) and (4) shall, so far as may be,
have effect as if the references to immovable property therein were references to such land or building or part
thereof, as the case may be.

269UF. Consideration for purchase of immovable property by Central Government.--

(1) Where an order for the purchase of any immovable property by the Central Government is made under sub-
section (1) of section 269UD, the Central Government shall pay, by way of consideration for such purchase, an
amount equal to the amount of the apparent consideration.

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1), where, after the agreement for the transfer of the
immovable property referred to in that sub-section has been made but before the property vests in the Central
Government under section 269UE, the property has been damaged (otherwise than as a result of normal wear and
tear), the amount of the consideration payable under that sub-section shall be reduced by such sum as the
appropriate authority, for reasons to be recorded in writing, may by order determine.

269UG. Payment of deposit of consideration.--

(1) The amount of consideration payable in accordance with the provisions of section 269UF shall be tendered to the
person or persons entitled thereto, within a period of one month from the end of the month in which the
1mmovable property concerned becomes vested in the Central Government under sub-section (1), or, as the case
may be, sub-section (6), of section 269UE :

Provided that if anK liability for any tax or any other sum remaining payable under this Act, the Wealth-tax Act,
1957 (27 of 1957), the Gift-tax Act, 1958 (18 of 1958), the Estate Duty Act, 1953 (34 of 1953), or the Companies
(Profits) Surtax Act, 1964 (7 of 1964), by any person entitled to the consideration payable under section 269UF,
the appropriate authority may, in lieu of the payment of the amount of consideration, set off the amount of
consideration or any part thereof against such Iiability or sum, after giving an intimation in this behalf to the
person entitled to the consideration.

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1), if any dispute arises as to the apportionment of the
amount of consideration amongst persons claiming to be entitled thereto, the Central Government shall deposit
with the appropriate authority the amount of consideration required to be tendered under sub-section (1) within
the period specified therein.

(3) Notwithstanding anythin§ contained in sub-section (1), if the person entitled to the amount of consideration does
not consent to receive it, or if there is any dispute as to the title to receive the amount of consideration, the Central
Government shall deposit with the appropriate authority the amount of consideration required to be tendered
under sub-section (1) within the period specified therein :

Provided that nothing herein contained shall affect the liability of any person who may receive the whole or any



part of the amount of consideration for any immovable property vested in the Central Government under this
Chapter to pay the same to the person lawfully entitled thereto.

(4) Where any amount of consideration has been deposited with the appropriate authority under this section, the
appropriate authority may, either of its own motion or on an algplicatlon made by or on behalf of any person
interested or claiming to be interested in such amount, order the same to be invested in such Government or other
securities as it may think pro}ll)er, and may direct the interest or other proceeds of any such investment to be
accumulated and paid in such manner as will, in its oFinion, give the parties interested therein the same benefits
therefrom as they might have had from the immovable property in respect whereof such amount has been
deposited or as near thereto as may be.

269UH. Re-vesting of property in the transferor on failure of payment or deposit of consideration.--

(1) If the Central Government fails to tender under sub-section (1) of section 269UG or deposit under sub-section (2)
or sub-section (3) of the said section, the whole or any part of the amount of consideration required to be tendered
or deposited thereunder within the period specified therein in respect of any immovable property which has vested
in the Central Government under sub-section (1) or, as the case may be, sub-section (6) of section 269UE, the order
to purchase the immovable property by the Central Government made under sub-section (1) of section 269UD shall
star}ddabrogated and the immovable property shall stand revested in the transferor after the expiry of the aforesaid
period :

Provided that where any dispute referred to in sub-section (2) or sub-section (3) of section 269UG is pending in
any court for decision, the time taken by the court to pass a final order under the said sub-section shall be
excluded in computing the said period.

(2) Where an order made under sub-section (1) of section 269UD is abrogated and the immovable proqerty re-vested
in the transferor under sub-section (1), the appropriate authority shall make, as soon as may be, a declaration in
writing to this effect and shall -

(a) deliver a copy of the declaration to the persons mentioned in sub-section (2) of section 269UD; and

(b) deliver or cause to be delivered possession of the immovable property back to the transferor or, as the case
may be, to such other person as was in possession of the property at the time of its vesting in the Central
Government under section 269UE.

269U1. Powers of the appropriate authority.—-

The appropriate authority shall have, for the purposes of this Chapter, all the powers that a Commissioner of
Income-tax has for the purposes of this Act under section 131.

269U]. Rectification of mistakes.—-

With a view to rectifying any mistake apparent from the record, the ap}irogriate authority may amend any order
made by it under this Chapter, either on its own motion or on the mistake being brought to its notice by any person
affected by the order:

Provided that if any such amendment is likely to affect any person prejudicially, it shall not be made without
giving to such person a reasonable opportunity of being heard :

Provided further that no amendment shall be made under this section after the expiry of six months from the
end of the month in which the order sought to be amended was made.

269UK. Restrictions on revocation or alteration of certain agreements for the transfer of immovable property or
transfer of certain immovableproperty.—-

(1) Notwithstanding anything contained in any other law for the time being in force, no person shall revoke or alter
an agreement for the transfer of an immovable property or transfer such property in respect of which a statement
has been furnished under section 269UC unless, -

(a) the appropriate authority has not made an order for the fpurchase of the immovable property by the Central
Government under section 269UD and the period specified for the making of such order has expired; or

(b) in a case where an order for the purchase of the immovable 1;))roperty by the Central Government has been
made under sub-section (1) of section 269UD, the order stands abrogated under sub-section (1) of section 269UH.

(2) Any transfer of any immovable property made in contravention of the provisions of sub-section (1) shall be void.
269UL. Restrictions on registration, etc., of documents in respect of transfer of immovable property.--

(1) Notwithstanding anything contained in any other law for the time being in force, no registering officer
appointed under the Registration Act, 1908 (16 of 1908), shall register any document which purports to transfer
immovable property exceeding the value prescribed under section 269UC unless a certificate from the appropriate
authority that it has no objection to the transfer of such propertY for an amount equal to the apparent consideration
therefor as stated in the agreement for transfer of the immovable property in respect of which it has received a
statement under sub-section (3) of section 269UC, is furnished, along with such document.

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in any other law for the time being in force, no person shall do anything or
omit to do anything which will have the effect of transfer of any immovable property unless the appropriate
authority certifies that it has no objection to the transfer of such property for an amount equal to the apparent
consideration therefor as stated in the agreement for transfer of the immovable property in respect of which it has
received a statement under sub-section (3) of section 269UC.

(3) In a case where the appropriate authority does not make an order under sub-section (1) of section 269UD for the
purchase by the Central Government of an immovable property, or where the order made under sub-section (1) of
section 269UD stands abrogated under sub-section (1) of section 269UH, the appropriate authority shall issue a
certificate of no objection referred to in sub-section (1) or, as the case may be, sub-section (2) and deliver copies
thereof to the transferor and the transferee.



269UM. Immunity to transferor against claims of transferee for transfer.--
Notwithstanding anything contained in any other law or in any instrument or any agreement for the time being in
force, when an order for the purchase of any immovable property by the Central Government is made under this
Chapter, no claim by the transferee shall lie against the transferor by reason of such transfer being not in
accordance with the agreement for the transfer of the immovable property entered into between the transferor and
the transferee :

Provided that nothing contained in this section shall apply if the order for the purchase of the immovable
property by the Central Government is abrogated under sub-section (1) of section 269UH.

269UN. Order of appropriate authority to be final and conclusive.--

Save as otherwise provided in this Chapter, any order made under sub-section (1) of section 269UD or any order
made under sub-section (2) of section 269UF shall be final and conclusive and shall not be called in question in any
proceeding under this Act or under any other law for the time being in force.

269U0. Chapter not to apply to certain transfers.—-

The provisions of this Chapter shall not apply to or in relation to any immovable Il)roperty where the agreement for
transfer of such property is made by a person to his relative on account of natural love and affection, if a recital to

that effect is made in the agreement for transfer.'.
Section 35 - Insertion Of New Section 272AA

In the Income-tax Act, after section 2724, the following section shall be inserted, namely :-

"272AA. Penalty for failure to comply with the provisions of section 133B-

MIfa Eerson, without reasonable cause, fails to comply with the provisions of section 133B, he shall, on an order
passed by the Inspecting Assistant Commissioner, Assistant Director of Inspection or the Income-tax Officer, as the
case may be, pay, by way of penalty, a sum which may extend to one thousand rupees.

(2) No order under sub-section (1) shall be passed unless the person on whom the penalty is proposed to be imposed
is given an opportunity of being heard in the matter.".

Section 36 - Insertion Of New Section 276AB

In the Income-tax Act, after section 2764, the following section shall be inserted, namely :-

"276AB. Failure to comply with the provisions of sections 269UC, 269UE and 269UL. - Whoever, without reasonable
cause or excuse, fails to comply with the provisions of section 269UC or fails to surrender or deliver possession of the
Eroperty under sub-section (2) of section 269UE or contravenes the provisions of sub-section (2) of section 269UL shall
e punishable with rigorous imprisonment for a term which may extend to two years and shall also be liable to fine :

Provided that in the absence of special and adequate reasons to the contrary to be recorded in the judgment of the
court, such imprisonment shall not be for less than six months".

Section 37 - Omission Of Section 276AA

Section 276AA of the Income-tax Act shall be omitted with effect from the 1st day of October, 1986.

Section 38 - Omission Of Twelfth Schedule

The Twelfth Schedule to the Income-tax Act shall be omitted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1987.

Section 39 - Consequential Amendments

The following amendments (being amendments of a consequential nature) shall be made in the Income-tax Act with effect
from the 1st day of April, 1987, namely :-

(a) in section 80A, in sub-section (3), -
(1) the words, figures and letter "or section 80K" shall be omitted;
(ii) the words, figures and letter "or section 80S" shall be omitted;
(iii) the words, figures and letters "or section 80TT" shall be omitted;
(b) in section 80VVA, in sub-section (2), -

(1) clause (xiiia) shall be renumbered as clause (xiiib), and before clause (xiiib) as so renumbered, the following
clause shall be inserted, namely :-



"(xiiia) section 32AB;";
(ii) clause (xxiv) shall be omitted;
(c) in section 197, -
(1) in sub-section (1) in clause (a), the figures and letters ", 194B, 194BB" shall be omitted;
(ii) sub-section (3) shall be omitted;

(d) in the Eleventh Schedule, after the words, figures and letter "See section 32A,", the word, figures and letters "section
32AB," shall be inserted.

Section 40 - Amendment Of Act 27 Of 1957

WEALTH-TAX
In section 5 of the Wealth-tax Act, 1957, -

(a) in sub-section (1), -
(1) after clause (xvid), the following clause shall be inserted, namely :-

'(xvie) in the case of an individual or a Hindu undivided famil%/, such debentures issued bg a }iublic sector
company, as the Central Government may, by notification in the Official Gazette, specify in this behalf.

Explanation : For the purposes of this clause, "public sector company" means any corporation established by or

under any Central, State or Provincial Act or a Government company as defined in section 617 of the Companies
Act, 1956 (1 of 1956);';

(ii) in clause (xxxiii), -
(A) in the opening paragraph, after the words "out of such moneys", the words "within one year immediately
preceding the date of his return and at any time thereafter" shall be inserted with effect from the 1st day of
April, 1987,
(B) the Explanation shall be numbered as Explanation 1 and after Explanation 1 as so numbered, the followin,
Explanation shall be inserted and shall be deemed to have been inserted with effect from the 1st day of April,
1977, namely :-
"Explanation 2 : For the removal of doubts, it is hereby declared that moneys standing to the credit of such
person in a Non-resident (External) Account in any bank in India in accordance with the Foreign Exchange
Regulation Act, 1973 (46 of 1973) and any rules made thereunder, on the date of his return to India, shall be
deemed to be moneys brought by him into India on that date.";

(b) in sub-section (3), -

(1) after the brackets, figures and letter "(xvid),", the brackets, figures and letter "(xvie)," shall be inserted;

(ii) for clause (aa), the following clause shall be substituted, namely :-
"(aa) in the case of Capital Investment Bonds referred to in clause (xvid), or debentures referred to in clause
(xvie), of sub-section (1), from the date on which the Bonds or debentures, as the case may be, were subscribed to

by the assessee, or for a period of at least six months ending with the relevant valuation date, whichever is
shorter; and"

Section 41 - Amendment Of Section 3

In the Gift-tax Act, 1958 (18 of 1958) (hereinafter referred to as the Gift-tax Act), with effect from the 1st day of April, 1987,
section 3 shall be renumbered as sub-section (1) thereof, and -

(a) in sub-section (1) as so renumbered, after the words, figures and letters "the 1st day of April, 1958,", the words,
figures and letters "but before the 1st day of April, 1987," shall be inserted;

(b) after sub-section (1) as so renumbered, the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely :-

"(2) Subject to the other provisions contained in this Act, there shall be charged for every assessment year
commencing on and from the 1st day of April, 1987, gift-tax in respect of the gifts, if any, made by a person during
the previous year, at the rate of thirty per cent. on the value of all taxable gifts.".

Section 42 - Amendment Of Section 5

In section 5 of the Gift-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1987,-

(a) in sub-section (1), clauses (iiia), (vi), (viii), (ix), (xiv) and (xvi) shall be omitted,;



(b) in sub-section (1A), the words, brackets and figures "or clause (vi)" shall be omitted;
(c) in sub-section (2), for the words "five thousand", the words "twenty thousand" shall be substituted;

(d) sub-section (3) shall be omitted.
Section 43 - Omission Of Section 6A
Section 6A of the Gift-tax Act shall be omitted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1987.
Section 44 - Amendment Of Section 18

In section 18 of the Gift-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1987,-

(a) in the opening portion, for the words, figure and letter "or, in a case where the provisions of section 6A are
applicable to a gift, in the manner specified in that section", the words, brackets and figures "or at the rate specified in
sub-section (2) of section 3" shall be substituted;

(b) in the Explanation, for the words, figure and letter "in the manner specified in section 6A", at both the places where
they occur, the words, brackets and figures "at the rate specified in sub-section (2) of section 3" shall be substituted.

Section 45 - Amendment Of Section 19A
In section 19A of the Gift-tax Act, in sub-section (2), after the words "or rates specified in the Schedule", the words,
brackets and figures "or, as the case may be, at the rate specified in sub-section (2) of section 3" shall be inserted with
effect from the 1st day of April, 1987.

Section 46 - Amendment Of The Schedule

In the Gift-tax Act, in the Schedule, for the brackets, words and figure "(See section 3)", the brackets, words and figures "
[See section 3(1)]" shall be substituted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1987.

Section 47 - Amendment Of Act 7 Of 1964

SURTAX

In the Companies (Profits) Surtax Act, 1964, in section 4, after the words and figures "the first day of April, 1964", the
words and figures "but before the first day of April, 1988" shall be inserted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1988.




