
SooperKanoon - India's Premier Online Legal Search - sooperkanoon.com

Source: sooperkanoon.com/act/9327

Finance Act, 2003

Chapter IV - Indirect Taxes

In section 2 of the Customs Act, 1962(52 of 1962) (hereinafter referred to as the Customs Act), in
clause (1B), for the words and brackets "Gold (Control)", the words "Service Tax" shall be
substituted.

Section 105 - Amendment of section 7

Section 7 of the Customs Act shall be numbered as sub-section (1) thereof,--

(a) in sub-section (1) as so numbered, for the words "Central Government", the word "Board"
shall be substituted;

(b) after sub-section (1) as so numbered, the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely:-

"(2) Every notification issued under this section and in force immediately before the
commencement of the Finance Act, 2003 shall, on such commencement, be deemed to have
been issued under the provisions of this section as amended by section 105 of the Finance Act,
2003 and shall continue to have the same force and effect after such commencement until it is
amended, rescinded or superseded under the provisions of this section.".

Section 106 - Amendment of section 15

In section 15 of the Customs Act, in sub-section (1), in clause (b), for the words "the goods are
actually removed from the warehouse", the words "a bill of entry for home consumption in respect of
such goods is presented under that section" shall be substituted.

Section 107 - Amendment of section 25

In section 25 of the Customs Act,-

(a) for sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:-

"(2) If the Central Government is satisfied that it is necessary in the public interest so to do, it
may, by special order in each case, exempt from the payment of duty, under circumstances of
an exceptional nature to be stated in such order, any goods on which duty is leviable.";

(b) after sub-section (5), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely:-

"(6) Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act, no duty shall be collected if the amount
of duty leviable is equal to, or less than, one hundred rupees.".

Section 108 - Amendment of section 27

https://sooperkanoon.com/
https://sooperkanoon.com/act/9327


In section 27 of the Customs Act, in sub-section (2), in the first proviso, in clause (a), after the word
"importer", the words "or the exporter, as the case may be" shall be inserted.

Section 109 - Amendment of section 28

In section 28 of the Customs Act, in sub-section (1), the second and third provisos shall be omitted.

Section 110 - Amendment of section 28E

In section 28E of the Customs Act,--

(a) for clause (c), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-

'(c) "applicant" means--

(i) a non-resident setting up a joint venture in India in collaboration with a non-resident or
a resident; or

(ii) a resident setting up a joint venture in India in collaboration with a non-resident; or

(iii) a wholly owned subsidiary Indian company, of which the holding company is a
foreign company,

who proposes to undertake any business activity in India and makes application for
advance ruling under sub-section (1) of section 28H;';

(b) for clause (h), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-

'(h) "non-resident", "Indian company" and "foreign company" have the meanings respectively
assigned to them in clauses (30), (26) and (23A) of section 2 of the Income-tax Act, 1961(43
of 1961).'.

Section 111 - Amendment of section 28H

In section 28H of the Customs Act, in sub-section (2), after clause (c), the following clause shall be
inserted, namely:--

"(d) applicability of notifications issued in respect of duties under this Act, the Customs Tariff
Act, 1975(51 of 1975) and any duty chargeable under any other law for the time being in force in
the same manner as duty of customs leviable under this Act.".

Section 112 - Amendment of section 30

In section 30 of the Customs Act, for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be substituted,
namely:-

"(1) The person-in-charge of--

(i) a vessel; or

(ii) an aircraft; or



(iii) a vehicle,

carrying imported goods or any other person as may be specified by the Central
Government, by notification in the Official Gazette, in this behalf shall, in the case of a
vessel or an aircraft, deliver to the proper officer an import manifest prior to the arrival of
the vessel or the aircraft, as the case may be, and in the case of a vehicle, an import report
within twelve hours after its arrival in the customs station, in the prescribed form and if the
import manifest or the import report or any part thereof, is not delivered to the proper
officer within the time specified in this sub-section and if the proper officer is satisfied that
there was no sufficient cause for such delay, the person-in-charge or any other person
referred to in this sub-section, who caused such delay, shall be liable to a penalty not
exceeding fifty thousand rupees.".

Section 113 - Amendment of section 61

In section 61 of the Customs Act,--

(a) in sub-section (1),--

(i) in clause (a), the word "and" shall be omitted;

(ii) after clause (a), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:-

"(aa) in the case of goods other than capital goods intended for use in any hundred per cent
export-oriented undertaking, till the expiry of three years; and";

(iii) in the proviso, in clause (i), for the words, brackets and letters "clause (a) or clause (b)",
the words, brackets and letters "clause (a) or clause (aa) or clause (b)" shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-section (2),-

(i) in clause (i), for the word, brackets and letter "sub-clause (a)", the words, brackets and
letters "sub-clause (a) or sub-clause (aa)" shall be substituted;

(ii) in clause (ii), for the words "thirty days", wherever they occur, the words "ninety days"
shall be substituted.

Section 114 - Amendment of section 68

In section 68 of the Customs Act, after clause (c), the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:--

"Provided that the owner of any warehoused goods may, at any time before an order for clearance
of goods for home consumption has been made in respect of such goods, relinquish his title to the
goods upon payment of rent, interest, other charges and penalties that may be payable in respect
of the goods and upon such relinquishment, he shall not be liable to pay duty thereon.".

Section 115 - Amendment of section 75A

In section 75A of the Customs Act, in sub-section (1),-

(a) for the words "two months", wherever they occur, the words "one month" shall be substituted;

(b) the proviso shall be omitted.



Section 116 - Amendment of section 113

In section 113 of the Customs Act,--

(a) in clauses (c), (e), (f), (g) and (h), the words "dutiable or prohibited", wherever they occur,
shall be omitted;

(b) for clause (i), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-

"(i) any goods entered for exportation which do not correspond in respect of value or in any
material particular with the entry made under this Act or in the case of baggage with the
declaration made under section 77;";

(c) in clause (k), the words "under a claim for drawback" shall be omitted.

Section 117 - Amendment of section 114

In section 114 of the Customs Act,--

(a) in clause (i), for the words "not exceeding the value of the goods or five thousand rupees", the
words "not exceeding three times the value of the goods as declared by the exporter or the value
as determined under this Act" shall be substituted;

(b) for clause (iii), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-

"(iii) in the case of any other goods, to a penalty not exceeding the value of the goods, as
declared by the exporter or the value as determined under this Act, whichever is the greater.".

Section 118 - Amendment of section 122

In section 122 of the Customs Act,--

(a) in clause (b), for the words "fifty thousand", the words "two lakh" shall be substituted;

(b) in clause (c), for the words "two thousand five hundred", the words "ten thousand" shall be
substituted.

Section 119 - Amendment of section 129

In section 129 of the Customs Act,--

(a) in sub-section (1), for the words and brackets "Gold (Control)", the words "Service Tax" shall
be substituted;

(b) in sub-section (2), for the words "Central Legal Service", the words "Indian Legal Service"
shall be substituted;

(c) sub-section (4A) shall be omitted;

(d) in sub-section (5), for the words "The Senior Vice-President or a Vice-President", the words
"A Vice-President" shall be substituted.



Section 120 - Substitution of new section for section 130

For section 130 of the Customs Act, the following section shall be substituted, namely:--

"130. Appeal to High Court.--

(1) An appeal shall lie to the High Court from every order passed in appeal by the Appellate
Tribunal on or after the 1st day of July, 2003 (not being an order relating, among other things,
to the determination of any question having a relation to the rate of duty of customs or to the
value of goods for the purposes of assessment), if the High Court is satisfied that the case
involves a substantial question of law.

(2) The Commissioner of Customs or the other party aggrieved by any order passed by the
Appellate Tribunal may file an appeal to the High Court and such appeal under this sub-
section shall be--

(a) filed within one hundred and eighty days from the date on which the order appealed
against is received by the Commissioner of Customs or the other party;

(b) accompanied by a fee of two hundred rupees where such appeal is filed by the other
party;

(c) in the form of a memorandum of appeal precisely stating therein the substantial
question of law involved.

(3) Where the High Court is satisfied that a substantial question of law is involved in any case,
it shall formulate that question.

(4) The appeal shall be heard only on the question so formulated, and the respondents shall, at
the hearing of the appeal, be allowed to argue that the case does not involve such question:

Provided that nothing in this sub-section shall be deemed to take away or abridge the
power of the Court to hear, for reasons to be recorded, the appeal on any other substantial
question of law not formulated by it, if it is satisfied that the case involves such question.

(5) The High Court shall decide the question of law so formulated and deliver such judgment
thereon containing the grounds on which such decision is founded and may award such cost as
it deems fit.

(6) The High Court may determine any issue which-

(a) has not been determined by the Appellate Tribunal; or

(b) has been wrongly determined by the Appellate Tribunal, by reason of a decision on
such question of law as is referred to in sub-section (1).

(7) When an appeal has been filed before the High Court, it shall be heard by a bench of not
less than two Judges of the High Court, and shall be decided in accordance with the opinion of
such Judges or of the majority, if any, of such Judges.

(8) Where there is no such majority, the Judges shall state the point of law upon which they
differ and the case shall, then, be heard upon that point only by one or more of the other
Judges of the High Court and such point shall be decided according to the opinion of the
majority of the Judges who have heard the case including those who first heard it.



(9) Save as otherwise provided in this Act, the provisions of the Code of Civil Procedure,
1908(5 of 1908), relating to appeals to the High Court shall, as far as may be, apply in the case
of appeals under this section.".

Section 121 - Amendment of section 130A

In section 130A of the Customs Act, in sub-section (1), for the words, figures and letters "on or after
the 1st day of July, 1999", the words, figures and letters "before the 1st day of July, 2003" shall be
substituted.

Section 122 - Amendment of section 130D

In section 130D of the Customs Act,--

(a) after sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be inserted with effect from the 1st day of
July, 2003, namely:-

"(1A) Where the High Court delivers a judgment in an appeal filed before it under section
130, effect shall be given to the order passed on the appeal by the proper officer on the basis
of a certified copy of the judgment.";

(b) in sub-section (2), for the words "reference to the High Court or the Supreme Court", the
words "reference to the High Court or an appeal to the High Court or the Supreme Court, as the
case may be," shall be substituted.

Section 123 - Amendment of section 130E

In section 130E of the Customs Act, for clause (a), the following clause shall be substituted, namely;-

"(a) any judgment of the High Court delivered-

(i) in an appeal made under section 130; or

(ii) on a reference made under section 130 by the Appellate Tribunal before the 1st day of
July, 2003;

(iii) on a reference made under section 130A,

in any case which, on its own motion or on an oral application made by or on behalf of the
party aggrieved, immediately after passing of the judgment, the High Court certifies to be a fit
one for appeal to the Supreme Court; or".

Section 124 - Amendment of section 135

In section 135 of the Customs Act, in sub-section (1),-

(a) in clause (a), after the words "knowingly concerned", the words "in mis-declaration of value
or" shall be inserted;

(b) in clause (b), for the word and figures "section 111,", the words and figures "section 111 or
section 113, as the case may be, or" shall be substituted;



(c) after clause (b), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:-

"(c) attempts to export any goods which he knows or has reason to believe are liable to
confiscation under section 113,".

Section 125 - Amendment of section 136

In section 136 of the Customs Act, in sub-section (1), for the words "connives at any act or thing
whereby", the words "connives at any act or thing, whereby any fraudulent export is effected or" shall
be substituted.

Section 126 - Amendment of notifications issued under section 25 of the Customs Act

(1) The notifications of the Government of India in the Ministry of Finance (Department of Revenue)
Nos. G.S.R. 465(E), dated the 3rd May, 1990 and G.S.R. 423(E), dated the 20th April, 1992, issued
under sub-section (1) of section 25 of the Customs Act by the Central Government shall stand
amended and shall be deemed to have been amended in the manner as specified against each of them
in column (3) of the Second Schedule, on and from the corresponding date mentioned in column (4)
of that Schedule retrospectively and, accordingly, notwithstanding anything contained in any
judgment, decree or order of any court, tribunal or other authority, any action taken or anything done
or purported to have been taken or done under the said notifications, shall be deemed to be, and
always to have been, for all purposes, as validly and effectively taken or done as if the notifications as
amended by this sub-section had been in force at all material times.

(2) For the purposes of sub-section (1), the Central Government shall have and shall be deemed to
have the power to amend the notifications referred to in the said sub-section with retrospective effect
as if the Central Government had the power to amend the said notifications under sub-section (1) of
section 25 of the Customs Act, retrospectively at all material times.

Section 127 - Amendment of notifications, relating to export promotion schemes, issued under section
25 of the Customs Act

(1) The notifications of the Government of India in the Ministry of Finance (Department of Revenue)
Nos. G.S.R. 308(E), dated the 31st March, 1995, G.S.R. 309(E), dated the 31st March, 1995, G.S.R.
480 (E), dated the 5th June, 1995, G.S.R. 657(E), dated the 19th September, 1995, G.S.R. 658(E),
dated the 19th September, 1995, G.S.R. 184(E), dated the 1st April, 1997, G.S.R. 186(E), dated the
1st April, 1997, G.S.R. 187(E), dated the 1st April, 1997, G.S.R. 197(E), dated the 7th April, 1997,
G.S.R. 216(E), dated the 11th April, 1997, G.S.R. 623(E), dated the 16th October, 1998, G.S.R.
299(E), dated the 29th April, 1999, G.S.R. 366(E), dated the 27th April, 2000 and G.S.R. 367(E),
dated the 27th April, 2000, issued under sub-section (1) of section 25 of the Customs Act by the
Central Government shall stand amended and shall be deemed to have been amended in the manner as
specified against each of them in column (3) of the Third Schedule, on and from the corresponding
date mentioned in column (4) of that Schedule retrospectively and, accordingly, notwithstanding
anything contained in any judgment, decree or order of any court, tribunal or other authority, any
action taken or anything done or purported to have been taken or done under the said notifications,
shall be deemed to be and always to have been, for all purposes, as validly and effectively, taken or
done as if the notifications as amended by this sub-section had been in force at all material times.

(2) For the purposes of sub-section (1), the Central Government shall have and shall be deemed to
have the power to amend the notifications referred to in the said sub-section with retrospective effect
as if the Central Government had the power to amend the said notifications under sub-section (1) of



section 25 of the Customs Act, retrospectively, at all material times.

(3) Refund shall be made of all amounts of interest which have been paid or, as the case may be,
which have not been refunded but which would not have been paid or, as the case may be, which
would have been refunded if the provisions of this section had been in force at all material times,
within a period of thirty days from the day on which the Finance Bill, 2003 receives the assent of the
President and subject to the provisions of this sub-section, the provisions of section 27 of the Customs
Act shall be applicable for such refund.

1128. [Omitted]

____________________________________

1Omitted by the Finance Act, 2005, w.e.f. 13.05.2005. Prior to omission it read as under:

Section 128 - Additional duty of customs (tea and tea waste)

(1) In the case of goods specified in the Fourth Schedule, being goods imported into India,
there shall be levied and collected for the purposes of the Union, by surcharge, an additional
duty of customs, at the rate specified in the said Schedule.

(2) The additional duty of customs referred to in sub-section (1) shall be in addition to any
other duties of customs chargeable on such goods under the Customs Act or any other law for
the time being in force.

(3) The provisions of the Customs Act and the rules and regulations made thereunder,
including those relating to refunds and exemptions from duties and imposition of penalty,
shall, as far as may be, apply in relation to the levy and collection of the additional duty of
customs leviable under this section in respect of the goods specified in the Fourth Schedule as
they apply in relation to the ievy and collection of the duties of customs on such goods under
that Act or those rules and regulations, as the case may be."

Section 129 to 134 - Customs tariff

Section 129 - Amendment of section 3

In section 3 of the Customs Tariff Act, 1975(51 of 1975) (hereinafter referred to as the Customs
Tariff Act), in sub-section (2), in clause (ii), for the words, brackets and figure "but not including the
duty referred to in sub-section (1)", the following shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have
been substituted retrospectively on and from the 1st day of March, 2002, namely:--

"but does not include-

(a) the special additional duty referred to in section 3A;

(b) the safeguard duty referred to in sections 8B and 8C;

(c) the countervailing duty referred to in section 9;

(d) the anti-dumping duty referred to in section 9A; and

(e) the duty referred to in sub-section (1)".



Section 130 - Amendment of section 3A

In section 3A of the Customs Tariff Act, in sub-section (2), in clause (ii), for the words, brackets and
figure "but not including the special additional duty referred to in sub-section (1); and", the following
shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted retrospectively on and from the 1st
day of March, 2002, namely:-

"but does not include-

(a) the safeguard duty referred to in sections 8B and 8C;

(b) the countervailing duty referred to in section 9;

(c) the anti-dumping duty referred to in section 9A;

(d) the special additional duty referred to in sub-section (1); and".

Section 131 - Amendment of section 9A

In section 9A of the Customs Tariff Act, in sub-section (1), in the Explanation, in clause (c), in sub-
clause (ii), in item (a), for the words "territory or", the words "territory to" shall be substituted.

Section 132 - Amendment of section 9C

In section 9C of the Customs Tariff Act, in sub-section (1), for the words and brackets "Gold
(Control)", the words "Service Tax" shall be substituted.

Section 133 - Amendment of First Schedule

In the First Schedule to the Customs Tariff Act, with effect from such date as the Central Government
may, by notification in the Official Gazette, appoint, in Chapter 15,--

(i) in tariff item 1516 10 00, for the entry in column (4), the entry "100 %" shall be substituted;

(ii) in tariff item 1516 20 11, for the entry in column (4), the entry "100%" shall be substituted;

(iii) in tariff item 1516 20 19, for the entry in column (4), the entry "100%" shall be substituted;

(iv) in tariff item 1516 20 21, for the entry in column (4), the entry "100%" shall be substituted;

(v) in tariff item 1516 20 29, for the entry in column (4), the entry "100%" shall be substituted;

(vi) in tariff item 1516 20 31, for the entry in column (4), the entry "100%" shall be substituted;

(vii) in tariff item 1516 20 39, for the entry in column (4), the-entry "100%" shall be substituted;

(viii) in tariff item 1516 20 91, for the entry in column (4), the entry "100%" shall be substituted;

(ix) in tariff item 1516 20 99, for the entry in column (4), the entry "100%" shall be substituted;

(x) in tariff item 1517 10 10, for the entry in column (4), the entry "100%" shall be substituted;

(xi) in tariff item 1517 10 21, for the entry in column (4), the entry "100%" shall be substituted;



(xii) in tariff item 1517 10 22, for the entry in column (4), the entry "100%" shall be substituted;

(xiii) in tariff item, 1517 10 29, for the entry in column (4), the entry "100%" shall be substituted;

(xiv) in tariff item 1517 90 10, for the entry in column (4), the entry "100%" shall be substituted;

(xv) in tariff item 1517 90 20, for the entry in column (4), the entry "100%" shall be substituted;

(xvi) in tariff item 1517 90 30, for the entry in column (4), the entry "100%" shall be substituted;

(xvii) in tariff item 1517 90 40, for the entry in column (4), the entry "100%" shall be substituted;

(xviii) in tariff item 1517 90 90, for the entry in column (4), the entry "100%" shall be substituted;

(xix) in tariff item 1518 00 11, for the entry in column (4), the entry "100%" shall be substituted;

(xx) in tariff item 1518 00 19, for the entry in column (4), the entry "100%" shall be substituted;

(xxi) in tariff item 1518 00 21, for the entry in column (4), the entry "100%" shall be substituted;

(xxii) in tariff item 1518 00 29, for the entry in column (4), the entry "100%" shall be substituted;

(xxiii) in tariff item 1518 00 31, for the entry in column (4), the entry "100%" shall be substituted;

(xxiv) in tariff item 1518 00 39, for the entry in column (4), the entry "100%" shall be substituted;

(xxv) in tariff item 1518 00 40, for the entry in column (4), the entry "100%" shall be substituted.

Section 134 - National Calamity Contingent Duty of Customs

(1) In the case of goods specified in the Seventh Schedule to the Finance Act, 2001(14 of 2001) as
amended by the Thirteenth Schedule, being goods imported into India, there shall be levied and
collected for the purposes of the Union, by surcharge, a duty of customs, to be called the National
Calamity Contingent Duty of Customs (hereinafter referred to as the National Calamity Duty of
Customs), at the rates specified in the said Seventh Schedule, as amended by the Thirteenth Schedule.

(2) The National Calamity Duty of Customs chargeable on the goods specified in the Seventh
Schedule to the Finance Act, 2001(14 of 2001) as amended by the Thirteenth Schedule shall be in
addition to any other duties of customs chargeable on such goods under the Customs Act or any other
law for the time being in force.

(3) For the purposes of calculating the National Calamity Duty of Customs under this section on any
goods specified in the Seventh Schedule to the Finance Act, 2001(14 of 2001) as amended by the
Thirteenth Schedule, where such duty is leviable at any percentage of its value, the value of such
goods shall be calculated in the same manner as the value of article for the purposes of additional duty
is calculated under the provisions of sub-section (2) of section 3 of the Customs Tariff Act.

(4) The provisions of the Customs Act and the rules and regulations made thereunder, including those
relating to refunds and exemptions from duties and imposition of penalty, shall, as far as may be,
apply in relation to the levy and collection of the National Calamity Duty of Customs leviable under
this section in respect of the goods specified in the Seventh Schedule to the Finance Act, 2001(14 of
2001) as amended by the Thirteenth Schedule, as they apply in relation to the levy and collection of
the duties of customs on such goods under that Act, or those rules and regulations, as the case may be.

2[Omitted]



__________________________________________________

2. Omitted by the Finance Act, 2005, w.e.f. 13.05.2005. Prior to omission it read as under:

"Explanation.-- For the removal of doubts, it is hereby declared that for the purposes of this
section, on the expiry of the period of operation of the amendments made in the Seventh Schedule
to the Finance Act, 2001(14 of 2001) in terms of section 169, the said Seventh Schedule but for
such amendment shall continue to operate as if the said amendment had not taken place."

Section 135 to 154 - Excise

Section 135 - Amendment of section 2

In section 2 of the Central Excise Act, 1944(1 of 1944) (hereinafter referred to as the Central Excise
Act),-

(a) in clause (aa), for the words and brackets "Gold (Control)", the words "Service Tax" shall be
substituted;

(b) in clause (f), for sub-clause (iii), the following sub-clause shall be substituted, namely:-

"(iii) which, in relation to the goods specified in the Third Schedule, involves packing or
repacking of such goods in a unit container or labelling or re-labelling of containers including
the declaration or alteration of retail sale price on it or adoption of any other treatment on the
goods to render the product marketable to the consumer,".

Section 136 - Amendment of section 4

In section 4 of the Central Excise Act,--

(a) in sub-section (1), the following Explanation shall be inserted at the end, namely:-

"Explanation.--For the removal of doubts, it is hereby declared that the price-cum-duty of the
excisable goods sold by the assessee shall be the price actually paid to him for the goods sold
and the money value of the additional consideration, if any, flowing directly or indirectly from
the buyer to the assessee in connection with the sale of such goods, and such price-cum-duty,
excluding sales tax and other taxes, if any, actually paid, shall be deemed to include the duty
payable on such goods.";

(b) in sub-section (3),-

(i) in clause (c),-

(A) in sub-clause (ii), for the words "payment of duty,", the words "payment of duty;"
shall be substituted;

(B) after sub-clause (ii), the following sub-clause shall be inserted, namely:-

"(iii) a depot, premises of a consignment agent or any other place or premises from where the
excisable goods are to be sold after their clearance from the factory,";

(ii) after clause (c), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:-



'(cc) "time of removal", in respect of the excisable goods removed from the place of
removal referred to in sub-clause (iii) of clause (c), shall be deemed to be the time at
which such goods are cleared from the factory;'.

Section 137 - Amendment of section 4A

In section 4A of the Central Excise Act, for sub-section (4), the following shall be substituted,
namely:-

'(4) Where any goods specified under sub-section (1) are excisable goods and the manufacturer--

(a) removes such goods from the place of manufacture, without declaring the retail sale price
of such goods on the packages or declares a retail sale price which is not the retail sale price as
required to be declared under the provisions of the Act, rules or other law as referred to in sub-
section (1); or

(b) tampers with, obliterates or alters the retail sale price declared on the package of such
goods after their removal from the place of manufacture, then, such goods shall be liable to
confiscation and the retail sale price of such goods shall be ascertained in the prescribed
manner and such price shall be deemed to be the retail sale price for the purposes of this
section.

Explanation 1.--For the purposes of this section, "retail sale price" means the maximum price at
which the excisable goods in packaged form may be sold to the ultimate consumer and includes
all taxes, local or otherwise, freight, transport charges, commission payable to dealers, and all
charges towards advertisement, delivery, packing, forwarding and the like and the price is the sole
consideration for such sale:

Provided that in case the provisions of the Act, rules or other law as referred to in sub-section (1)
require to declare on the package, the retail sale price excluding any taxes, local or otherwise, the
retail sale price shall be construed accordingly.

Explanation 2.--For the purposes of this section,-

(a) where on the package of any excisable goods more than one retail sale price is declared,
the maximum of such retail sale prices shall be deemed to be the retail sale price;

(b) where the retail sale price, declared on the package of any excisable goods at the time of
its clearance from the place of manufacture, is altered to increase the retail sale price, such
altered retail sale price shall be deemed to be the retail sale price;

(c) where different retail sale prices are declared on different packages for the sale of any
excisable goods in packaged form in different areas, each such retail sale price shall be the
retail sale price for the purposes of valuation of the excisable goods intended to be sold in the
area to which the retail sale price relates.'.

Section 138 - Amendment of section 5A

In section 5A of the Central Excise Act, for sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall be
substituted, namely:-

"(2) If the Central Government is satisfied that it is necessary in the public interest so to do, it
may, by special order in each case, exempt from payment of duty of excise, under circumstances



of an exceptional nature to be stated in such order, any excisable goods on which duty of excise is
leviable.".

Section 139 - Amendment of section 11A

In section 11A of the Central Excise Act,--

(a) in sub-section (1), the second and third provisos shall be omitted;

(b) in sub-section (2B), after the words "pay the amount of duty", the words "on the basis of his
own ascertainment of such duty or on the basis of duty ascertained by a Central Excise Officer"
shall be inserted.

Section 140 - Insertion of new section 11DD

After section 11D of the Central Excise Act, the following section shall be inserted, namely:-

"11DD. Interest on the amounts collected in excess of the duty.--

(1) Where an amount has been collected in excess of the duty assessed or determined and paid
on any excisable goods under this Act or the rules made thereunder from the buyer of such
goods, the person who is liable to pay such amount as determined under sub-section (3) of
section 11D, shall, in addition to the amount, be liable to pay interest at such rate not below
ten per cent., and not exceeding thirty-six per cent. per annum, as is for the time being fixed
by the Central Government, by notification in the Official Gazette, from the first day of the
month succeeding the month in which the amount ought to have been paid under this Act, but
for the provisions contained in sub-section (3) of section 11D, till the date of payment of such
amount:

Provided that in such cases where the amount becomes payable consequent to issue of an
order, instruction or direction by the Board under section 37B, and such amount payable is
voluntarily paid in full, without reserving any right to appeal against such payment at any
subsequent stage, within forty-five days from the date of issue of such order, instruction or
direction, as the case may be, no interest shall be payable and in other cases the interest
shall be payable on the whole amount, including the amount already paid.

(2) The provisions of sub-section (1) shall not apply to cases where the amount had become
payable or ought to have been paid before the day on which the Finance Bill, 2003 receives
the assent of the President.

Explanation 1.--Where the amount determined under sub-section (3) of section 11D is reduced by
the Commissioner (Appeals), the Appellate Tribunal or, as the case may be, the court, the interest
payable thereon under sub-section (1) shall be on such reduced amount.

Explanation 2.--Where the amount determined under sub-section (3) of section 11D is increased
by the Commissioner (Appeals), the Appellate Tribunal or, as the case may be, the court, the
interest payable thereon under sub-section (1) shall be on such increased amount.".

Section 141 - Substitution of new section for section 13

For section 13 of the Central Excise Act, the following section shall be substituted, namely:-



"13. Power to arrest.--

Any Central Excise Officer not below the rank of Inspector of Central Excise may, with the
prior approval of the Commissioner of Central Excise, arrest any person whom he has reason
to believe to be liable to punishment under this Act or the rules made thereunder.".

Section 142 - Amendment of section 23A

In section 23A of the Central Excise Act,-

(a) for clause (c), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-

'(c) "applicant" means--

(i) a non-resident setting up a joint venture in India in collaboration with a non-resident or
a resident; or

(ii) a resident setting up a joint venture in India in collaboration with a non-resident; or

(iii) a wholly owned subsidiary Indian company, of which the holding company is a
foreign company,

who proposes to undertake any business activity in India and makes application for
advance ruling;';

(b) for clause (f), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-

'(f) "non-resident", "Indian company" and "foreign company" shall have the meanings
respectively assigned to them in clauses (30), (26) and (23A) of section 2 of the Income-tax
Act, 1961(43 of 1961).',

Section 143 - Amendment of section 23C

In section 23C of the Central Excise Act, in sub-section (2), after clause (c) the following clauses
shall be inserted, namely:-

"(d) notifications issued, in respect of duties of excise under this Act, the Central Excise Tariff
Act, 1985(5 of 1985) and any duty chargeable under any other law for the time being in force in
the same manner as duty of excise leviable under this Act;

(e) admissibility of credit of excise duty paid or deemed to have been paid on the goods used in or
in relation to the manufacture of the excisable goods.".

Section 144 - Substitution of new section for section 35G

For section 35G of the Central Excise Act, the following section shall be substituted, narnely:-

"35G. Appeal to High Court.--

(1) An appeal shall lie to the High Court from every order passed in appeal by the Appellate
Tribunal on or after the 1st day of July, 2003 (not being an order relating, among other things,
to the determination of any question having a relation to the rate of duty of excise or to the
value of goods for the purposes of assessment), if the High Court is satisfied that the case



involves a substantial question of law.

(2) The Commissioner of Central Excise or the other party aggrieved by any order passed by
the Appellate Tribunal may file an appeal to the High Court and such appeal under this sub-
section shall be--

(a) filed within one hundred and eighty days from the date on which the order appealed
against is received by the Commissioner of Central Excise or the other party;

(b) accompanied by a fee of two hundred rupees where such appeal is filed by the other
party;

(c) in the form of a memorandum of appeal precisely stating therein the substantial
question of law involved.

(3) Where the High Court is satisfied that a substantial question of law is involved in any case,
it shall formulate that question.

(4) The appeal shall be heard only on the question so formulated, and the respondents shall, at
the hearing of the appeal, be allowed to argue that the case does not involve such question:

Provided that nothing in this sub-section shall be deemed to take away or abridge the
power of the Court to hear, for reasons to be recorded, the appeal on any other substantial
question of law not formulated by it, if it is satisfied that the case involves such question.

(5) The High Court shall decide the question of law so formulated and deliver such judgment
thereon containing the grounds on which such decision is founded and may award such cost as
it deems fit.

(6) The High Court may determine any issue which--

(a) has not been determined by the Appellate Tribunal; or

(b) has been wrongly determined by the Appellate Tribunal, by reason of a decision on
such question of law as is referred to in sub-section (1).

(7) When an appeal has been filed before the High Court, it shall be heard by a bench of not
less than two Judges of the High Court, and shall be decided in accordance with the opinion of
such Judges or of the. majority, if any, of such Judges.

(8) Where there is no such majority, the Judges shall state the point of law upon which they
differ and the case shall, then, be heard upon that point only by one or more of the other
Judges of the High Court and such point shall be decided according to the opinion of the
majority of the Judges who have heard the case including those who first heard it.

(9) Save as otherwise provided in this Act, the provisions of the Code of Civil Procedure,
1908(5 of 1908), relating to appeals to the High Court shall, as far as may be, apply in the case
of appeals under this section."

Section 145 - Amendment of section 35H

In section 35H of the Central Excise Act, in sub-section (1), for the words, figures and letters "on or
after the 1st day of July, 1999", the words, figures and letters "before the 1st day of July, 2003" shall
be substituted.



Section 146 - Amendment of section 35K

In section 35K of the Central Excise Act,-

(a) after sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be inserted with effect from the 1st day of
July, 2003, namely:-

"(1A) Where the High Court delivers a judgment in an appeal filed before it under section
35G, effect shall be given to the order passed on the appeal by the concerned Central Excise
Officer on the basis of a certified copy of the judgment.";

(b) in sub-section (2), for the words "reference to the High Court or the Supreme Court", the
words "reference to the High Court or an appeal to the High Court or the Supreme Court, as the
case may be" shall be substituted.

Section 147 - Amendment of section 35L

In section 35L of the Central Excise Act, for clause (a), the following clause shall be substituted,
namely:--

"(a) any judgment of the High Court delivered-

(i) in an appeal made under section 35G; or

(ii) on a reference made under section 35G by the Appellate Tribunal before the 1st day of
July, 2003;

(iii) on a reference made under section 35H,

in any case which, on its own motion or on an oral application made by or on behalf of the
party aggrieved, immediately after passing of the judgment, the High Court certifies to be a fit
one for appeal to the Supreme Court; or".

Section 148 - Insertion of new Schedule in the Central Excise Act

After the Second Schedule to the Central Excise Act, the Schedule specified in the Fifth Schedule
shall be inserted.

Section 149 - Amendment of rule 57R of the Central Excise Rules, 1944

(1) In the Central Excise Rules, 1944, made by the Central Government in exercise of the powers
conferred by section 37 of the Central Excise Act, in rule 57R,-

(a) sub-rule (5) as substituted by the Central Excise (Third Amendment) Rules, 1996, published in
the Official Gazette, vide notification of the Government of India in the Ministry of Finance
(Department of Revenue) No. G.S.R. 324(E), dated the 23rd July, 1996; and

(b) sub-rule (8) as inserted by the Central Excise (Amendment) Rules, 1997, published in the
Official Gazette, vide notification of the Government of India in the Ministry of Finance
(Department of Revenue) No. G.S.R. 122(E), dated the 1st March, 1997,



shall stand amended and shall be deemed to have been amended retrospectively in the manner as
specified in column (3) of the Sixth Schedule on and from the corresponding date specified in
column (4) of that Schedule against each of said sub-rules specified in column (2) of that
Schedule till the date on which those sub-rules were superseded and accordingly, notwithstanding
anything contained in any judgment, decree or order of any court, tribunal or other authority, any
action taken or anything done or purported to have been taken or done under the said sub-rules as
so amended, shall be deemed to be, and always to have been, for all purposes, as validly and
effectively, taken or done as if the said sub-rules, as amended by this sub-section, had been in
force at all material times.

(2) Notwithstanding the supersession of the Central Excise Rules, 1944 referred to in sub-section (1),
for the purposes of that sub-section, the Central Government shall have and shall be deemed to have
the power to make rules with retrospective effect as if the Central Government had the power to make
rules under section 37 of the Central Excise Act, retrospectively at all material times.

(3) Credit shall be allowed of all such specified duty, which have been disallowed but which would
not have been disallowed if the amendment made by sub-section (1) had been in force at all material
times.

(4) Refund shall be made of all such credit of specified duty, which have been collected but which
would have not been collected if the amendment made by sub-section (1) had been in force at all
material times.

(5) Notwithstanding anything contained in section 11B of the Central Excise Act, an application for
the claim of refund of the credit of the specified duty paid on capital goods under sub-section (3) shall
be made within six months from the day on which the Finance Bill, 2003 receives the assent of the
President.

Explanation.--For the purposes of this section, the expression "specified duty" has the meaning
assigned to it in rule 57Q of the Central Excise Rules, 1944 referred to in sub-section (1).

Section 150 - Amendment of rules 57F and 57AB of the Central Excise Rules, 1944

(1) In the Central Excise Rules, 1944, made by the Central Government in exercise of the powers
conferred by section 37 of the Central Excise Act,--

(a) in rule 57F, sub-rule (12), as substituted by clause (a) of rule 8 of the Central Excise
(Amendment) Rules, 1997, published in the Official Gazette vide notification of the Government
of India in the Ministry of Finance (Department of Revenue), No. G.S.R. 122(E), dated the 1st
March, 1997; and

(b) in rule 57AB, in sub-rule (1), clause (b), as substituted by rule 5 of the Central Excise (Second
Amendment) Rules, 2000, published in the Official Gazette vide notification of the Government
of India in the Ministry of Finance (Department of Revenue), No. G.S.R. 203(E), dated the 1st
March, 2000,

shall stand amended and shall be deemed to have been amended retrospectively in the manner as
specified in column (3) of the Sixth Schedule, on and from the corresponding date specified in
column (4) of that Schedule against each of the said sub-rules specified in column (2) of that
Schedule till the date on which those sub-rules, were superseded.

(2) Any action taken or anything done or purported to have been taken or done, at any time during the
period commencing on and from the 8th day of July, 1999 and ending with the day on which the
Finance Bill, 2003 receives the assent of the President, under the Central-Excise Act or any rules



made thereunder for not allowing the credit of specified duty or the CENVAT credit, as the case may
be, to be taken or utilised which would have been allowed to be taken or utilised but for the
amendments made by sub-section (1) shall be deemed to be, and to always have been, for all
purposes, as validly and effectively taken or done as if the amendments made by sub-section (1) had
been in force at all material times, and accordingly, notwithstanding anything contained in any
judgment, decree or order of any court, tribunal or other authority-

(a) no suit or other proceedings shall be maintained or continued in any court for allowing the
credit of specified duty or the CENVAT credit, as the case may be, and no enforcement shall be
made by any court of any decree or order allowing the credit of specified duty or the CENVAT
credit, as the case may be, not allowed to be taken or utilised as if the amendments made by sub-
section (1) had been in force at all material times;

(b) recovery shall be made of all the credit of specified duty or the CENVAT credit, which have
been taken and utilised but which would not have been allowed to be taken and utilised, if the
amendments made by sub-section (1) had been in force at all material times, within a period of
thirty days from the day on which the Finance Bill, 2003 receives the assent of the President and
in the event of nonpayment of such credit of duties within this period, in addition to the amount of
credit of such duties recoverable, interest at the rate of fifteen per cent. per annum shall be
payable, from the date immediately after the expiry of the said period of thirty days till the date of
payment.

(3) Notwithstanding the supersession of the Central Excise Rules, 1944 referred to in sub-section (1),
for the purposes of that sub-section, the Central Government shall have and shall be deemed to have
the power to make the rules with retrospective effect as if the Central Government had the power to
make rules under section 37 of the Central Excise Act, retrospectively at all material times.

Explanation 1.--For the removal of doubts, it is hereby declared that no act or omission on the part
of any person shall be punishable as an offence which would not have been so punishable if this
section had not come into force.

Explanation 2.--For the purposes of this section, the expressions "specified duty" and "CENVAT
credit" have the meanings respectively assigned to them in rules 57A and 57AB of the Central
Excise Rules, 1944 referred to in sub-section (1).

Section 151 - Amendment of rule 3 of the CENVAT Credit Rules, 2001

(1) In the CENVAT Credit Rules, 2001, made by the Central Government in exercise of the powers
conferred by section 37 of the Central Excise Act, sub-rule (3) of rule 3 thereof as published in the
Official Gazette vide notification of the Government of India in the Ministry of Finance (Department
of Revenue) No. G.S.R. 445(E), dated the 21st June, 2001 shall stand amended and shall be deemed
to have been, amended retrospectively in the manner as specified in column (2) of the Seventh
Schedule, on and from the corresponding date specified in column (3) of that Schedule till the date on
which the said CENVAT Credit Rules were superseded.

(2) Any action taken or anything done or purported to have been taken or done at any time during the
period commencing on and from the 1st day of July, 2001 and ending with the day on which the
Finance Bill, 2003 receives the assent of the President, under the Central Excise Act or any rules
made thereunder for not allowing the CENVAT credit to be taken or utilised which would have been
allowed to be taken or utilised, but for the amendment made by sub-section (1), shall be deemed to
be, and to always have been, for all purposes, as validly and effectively taken or done as if the
amendment made by sub-section (1) had been in force at all material times, and accordingly,
notwithstanding anything contained in any judgment, decree or order of any court, tribunal or other



authority-

(a) no suit or other proceedings shall be maintained or continued in any court for allowing the
CENVAT credit and no enforcement shall be made by any court of any decree or order allowing
the CENVAT credit not allowed to be taken or utilised if the amendment made by sub-section (1)
had been in force at all material times;

(b) recovery shall be made of all the CENVAT credit, which have been taken and utilised but
which would not have been allowed to be taken and utilised, if the amendment made by sub-
section (1) had been in force at all material times, within a period of thirty days from the day on
which the Finance Bill, 2003 receives the assent of the President and in the event of non-payment
of such CENVAT credit within this period, in addition to the amount of such CENVAT credit
recoverable, interest at the rate of fifteen per cent. per annum shall be payable, from the date
immediately after the expiry of the said period of thirty days till the date of payment.

(5) Notwithstanding the supersession of the CENVAT Credit Rules, 2001 referred to in sub-section
(1), for the purposes of that sub-section, the Central Government shall have and shall be deemed to
have the power to make the rules with retrospective effect as if the Central Government had the
power to make rules under section 37 of the Central Excise Act, retrospectively at all material times.

Explanation 1.--For the removal of doubts, it is hereby declared that no act or omission on the part
of any person shall be punishable as an offence which would not have been so punishable if this
section had not come into force.

Explanation 2.--For the purposes of this section, the expression "CENVAT credit" has the
meaning assigned to it in the CENVAT Credit Rules, 2001 referred to in sub-section (1).

Section 152 - Amendment of rule 3 of the CENVAT Credit Rules, 2002

(1) In the CENVAT Credit Rules, 2002, made by the Central Government in exercise of the powers
conferred by section 37 of the Central Excise Act, in rule 3, in sub-rule (3), the second proviso, as
inserted by the CENVAT Credit (Amendment) Rules, 2002, published in the Official Gazette vide
notification of the Government of India in the Ministry of Finance (Department of Revenue), No.
G.S.R. 835(E), dated the 23rd December, 2002 shall be deemed to have and to have always had effect
on and from the 1st day of March, 2002.

(2) Any action taken or anything done or purported to have been taken or done at any time during the
period commencing on and from the 1st day of March, 2002 and ending with the day on which the
Finance Bill, 2003 receives the assent of the President, under the Central Excise Act or any rules
made thereunder for not allowing the CENVAT credit to be taken or utilised which would have been
allowed to be taken or utilised but for the amendment made by sub-section (1), shall be deemed to be,
and to always have been, for all purposes, as validly and effectively taken or done as if the
amendment made by sub-section (1) had been in force at all material times, and accordingly,
notwithstanding anything contained in any judgment, decree or order of any court, tribunal or other
authority--

(a) no suit or other proceedings shall be maintained or continued in any court for allowing the
CENVAT credit and no enforcement shall be made by any court of any decree or order allowing
the CENVAT credit not allowed to be taken or utilised if the amendment made by sub-section (1)
had been in force at all material times;

(b) recovery shall be made of all the CENVAT credit, which have been taken and utilised but
which would not have been allowed to be taken and utilised, if the amendment made by sub-



section (1) had been in force at all material times, within a period of thirty days from the day on
which the Finance Bill, 2003 receives the assent of the President and in the event of non-payment
of such CENVAT credit within this period, in addition to the amount of such CENVAT credit
recoverable, interest at the rate of fifteen per cent. per annum shall be payable, from the date
immediately after the expiry of the said period of thirty days till the date of payment.

(3) For the purposes of sub-section (1), the Central Government shall have and shall be deemed to
have the power to make rules with retrospective effect as if the Central Government had the power to
make rules under section 37 of the Central Excise Act, retrospectively at all material times.

Explanation 1.--For the removal of doubts, it is hereby declared that no act or omission on the part
of any person shall be punishable as an offence which would not have been so punishable if this
section had not come into force.

Explanation 2.--For the purposes of this section, the expression "CENVAT credit" has the
meaning assigned to it in the CENVAT Credit Rules, 2002 referred to in sub-section (1).

Section 153 - Amendment of notifications issued under section 5A of the Central Excise Act for certain
period

(1) The notifications of the Government of India in the Ministry of Finance (Department of Revenue)
Nos. G.S.R. 508(E), dated the 8th July, 1999 and G.S.R. 509(E), dated the 8th July, 1999, issued
under sub-section (1) of section 5A of the Central Excise Act read with sub-section (3) of section 3 of
the Additional Duties of Excise (Goods of Special Importance) Act, 1957(58 of 1957) and sub-section
(3) of section 3 of the Additional Duties of Excise (Textiles and Textile Articles) Act, 1978(40 of
1978) by the Central Government shall stand amended and shall be deemed to have been amended in
the manner as specified in the Eighth Schedule, on and from the 8th day of July, 1999 to the 22nd day
of December, 2002 (both days inclusive) retrospectively, and accordingly, notwithstanding anything
contained in any judgment, decree or order of any court, Tribunal or other authority, any action taken
or anything done or purported to have been taken or done under the said notifications, shall be
deemed to be and always to have been, for all purposes, as validly and effectively taken or done as if
the notifications as amended by this sub-section had been in force at all material times.

(2) For the purposes of sub-section (1), the Central Government shall have and shall be deemed to
have the power to amend the notifications referred to in the said sub-section with retrospective effect
as if the Central Government had the power to amend the said notifications under sub-section (1) of
section 5A of the Central Excise Act read with sub-section (3) of section 3 of the Additional Duties of
Excise (Goods of Special Importance) Act, 1957(58 of 1957) and sub-section (3) of section 3 of the
Additional Duties of Excise (Textiles and Textile Articles) Act, 1978(40 of 1978), retrospectively at
all material times.

(3) Notwithstanding the cessation of the amendment under sub-section (1) on the 22nd day of
December, 2002, no suit or other proceedings shall be maintained or continued in any court, tribunal
or other authority for any action taken or anything done or omitted to be done, in respect of any goods
under the said notifications, and no enforcement shall be made by any court, tribunal or other
authority of any decree or order relating to such action taken or anything done or omitted to be done
as if the amendment made by sub-section (1) had been in force at all material times.

(4) Notwithstanding the cessation of the amendment under sub-section (1) on the 22nd day of
December, 2002, recovery shall be made of all amounts of duty or interest or other charges which
have not been collected or, as the case may be, which have been refunded but which would have been
collected or, as the case may be, which would not have been refunded if the provisions of this section
had been in force at all material times, within a period of thirty days from the day on which the



Finance Bill, 2003 receives the assent of the President, and in the event of non-payment of duty or
interest or other charges so recoverable, interest at the rate of fifteen per cent. per annum shall be
payable, from the date immediately after the expiry of the said period of thirty days, till the date of
payment.

Explanation.--For the removal of doubts, it is hereby declared that no act or omission on the part
of any person shall be punishable as an offence which would not have been so punishable if the
notifications referred to in sub-section (1) had not been amended retrospectively by that sub-
section.

Section 154. - Amendment of notifications issued under section 5A of the Central Excise Act

(1) The notifications of the Government of India in the Ministry of Finance (Department of Revenue)
Nos. G.S.R. 508(E), dated the 8th July, 1999 and G.S.R. 509(E), dated the 8th July, 1999, issued
under sub-section (1) of section 5A of the Central Excise Act read with sub-section (3) of section 3 of
the Additional Duties of Excise (Goods of Special Importance) Act, 1957(58 of 1957) and sub-section
(3) of section 3 of the Additional Duties of Excise (Textiles and Textile Articles) Act, 1978(40 of
1978), by the Central Government shall stand amended and shall be deemed to have been amended in
the manner as specified against each of them in column (3) of the Ninth Schedule, on and from the
corresponding date specified in column (4) of that Schedule retrospectively, and accordingly,
notwithstanding anything contained in any judgment, decree or order of any court, tribunal or other
authority, any action taken or anything done or purported to have been taken or done under the said
notifications, shall be deemed to be and always to have been, for all purposes, as validly and
effectively taken or done as if the notifications as amended by this sub-section had been in force at all
material times.

(2) For the purposes of sub-section (1), the Central Government shall have and shall be deemed to
have the power to amend the notifications referred to in the said sub-section with retrospective effect
as if the Central Government had the power to amend the said notifications under sub-section (1) of
section 5A of the Central Excise Act read with sub-section (3) of section 3 of the Additional Duties of
Excise (Goods of Special Importance) Act, 1957(58 of 1957) and sub-section (3) of section 3 of the
Additional Duties of Excise (Textiles and Textile Articles) Act, 1978(40 of 1978), retrospectively at
all material times.

(3) No suit or other proceedings shall be maintained or continued in any court, tribunal or other
authority for any action taken or anything done or omitted to be done, in respect of any goods under
the said notifications, and no enforcement shall be made by any court, tribunal or other authority of
any decree or order relating to such action taken or anything done or omitted to be done as if the
amendments made by sub-section (1) had been in force at all material times.

(4) Recovery shall be made of all amounts of duty or interest or other charges which have not been
collected or, as the case may be, which have been refunded but which would have been collected or,
as the case may be, which would have not been refunded if the provisions of this section had been in
force at all material times, within a period of thirty days from the day on which the Finance Bill, 2003
receives the assent of the President, and in the event of nonpayment of duty or interest or other
charges so recoverable, interest at the rate of fifteen per cent. per annum shall be payable from the
date immediately after the expiry of the said period of thirty days till the date of payment.

Explanation.--For the removal of doubts, it is hereby declared that no act or omission on the part
of any person shall be punishable as an offence which would not have been so punishable if the
notifications referred to in sub-section (1) had not been amended retrospectively by that sub-
section.



Central Excise Tariff

Section 155 to 157 - Central Excise Tariff

Section 155 - Amendment of First and Second Schedules to Act 5 of 1986

In the Central Excise Tariff Act, 1985 (hereinafter referred to as the Central Excise Tariff Act),-

(a) the First Schedule shall be amended in the manner as specified in the Tenth Schedule;

(b) the Second Schedule shall be amended in the manner as specified in the Eleventh Schedule.

Section 156 - Amendment of Second Schedule to Act 58 of 1957

In the Additional Duties of Excise (Goods of Special Importance) Act, 1957, in the Second Schedule,
in paragraph 4, in sub-paragraph (i), for the proviso, the following proviso shall be substituted, with
effect from such date as may be notified by the Central Government in the Official Gazette for this
purpose, namely:-

"Provided that, if during each of the financial years commencing on and after the 1st day of April,
2003, there is levied and collected in any State a tax on the sale or purchase of the goods
described in column (3) of the First Schedule at a rate exceeding four per cent., of the value of
such goods determined in accordance with section 4 of the Central Excise Act, 1944(1 of 1944),
no sums shall be payable to that State, under this paragraph in respect of that financial year, unless
the Central Government, by special order, otherwise directs.".

3[157 Omitted]

_______________________________

3. Omitted by the Finance Act, 2005, w.e.f. 13.05.2005. Prior to omission it read as under:

157. Additional duty of excise (tea and tea waste) .--

(1) In the case of goods specified in the Fourth Schedule, being goods manufactured in India,
there shall be levied and collected for the purposes of the Union, by surcharge, an additional
duty of excise, at the rate specified in the said Schedule.

(2) The additional duty of excise referred to in sub-section (1), shall be in addition TO any
other duties of excise chargeable on such goods under the Central Excise Act or any other law
for the time being in force.

(3) The provisions of the Central Excise Act and the rules made thereunder, including
those relating to refunds and exemptions from duties and imposition of penalty, shall,
as far as may be, apply in relation to the levy and collection of the additional duty of
excise leviable under this section in respect of the goods specified in the Fourth
Schedule as they apply in relation to the levy and collection of the duties of excise on
such goods under that Act or those rules, as the case may be.

1. Omitted by the Finance Act, 2005, w.e.f. 13.05.2005. Prior to omission it read as under:

"128. Additional duty of customs (tea and tea waste) .--



(1) In the case of goods specified in the Fourth Schedule, being goods imported into India,
there shall be levied and collected for the purposes of the Union, by surcharge, an additional
duty of customs, at the rate specified in the said Schedule.

(2) The additional duty of customs referred to in sub-section (1) shall be in addition to any
other duties of customs chargeable on such goods under the Customs Act or any other law for
the time being in force.

(3) The provisions of the Customs Act and the rules and regulations made thereunder,
including those relating to refunds and exemptions from duties and imposition of penalty,
shall, as far as may xbe, apply in relation to the levy and collection of the additional duty of
customs leviable under this section in respect of the goods specified in the Fourth Schedule as
they apply in relation to the ievy and collection of the duties of customs on such goods under
that Act or those rules and regulations, as the case may be."

2 Omitted by the Finance Act, 2005, w.e.f. 13.05.2005. Prior to omission it read as under:

" Explanation.--For the removal of doubts, it is hereby declared that for the purposes of this
section, on the expiry of the period of operation of the amendments made in the Seventh Schedule
to the Finance Act, 2001(14 of 2001) in terms of section 169, the said Seventh Schedule but for
such amendment shall continue to operate as if the said amendment had not taken place."

3 Omitted by the Finance Act, 2005, w.e.f. 13.05.2005. Prior to omission it read as under:

Section 157 - Additional duty of excise (tea and tea waste)

(1) In the case of goods specified in the Fourth Schedule, being goods manufactured in India, there
shall be levied and collected for the purposes of the Union, by surcharge, an additional duty of excise,
at the rate specified in the said Schedule.

(2) The additional duty of excise referred to in sub-section (1), shall be in addition TO any other
duties of excise chargeable on such goods under the Central Excise Act or any other law for the time
being in force.

(3) The provisions of the Central Excise Act and the rules made thereunder, including those relating
to refunds and exemptions from duties and imposition of penalty, shall, as far as may be, apply in
relation to the levy and collection of the additional duty of excise leviable under this section in respect
of the goods specified in the Fourth Schedule as they apply in relation to the levy and collection of the
duties of excise on such goods under that Act or those rules, as the case may be.

SooperKanoon - India's Premier Online Legal Search - sooperkanoon.com


