
SooperKanoon - India's Premier Online Legal Search - sooperkanoon.com

Source: sooperkanoon.com/act/443646

Finance Act 2007

Section 132 - Amendment of Section 37

In section 37 of the Central Excise Act,--

(i) in sub-section (4), for the words "ten thousand rupees", the words "two thousand rupees" shall

be substituted;

(ii) in sub-section (5), for the words "ten thousand rupees", the words "two thousand rupees" shall

be substituted.

SooperKanoon - India's Premier Online Legal Search - sooperkanoon.com

https://sooperkanoon.com/
https://sooperkanoon.com/act/443646

