Sooper Kanoon - India’'s Premier Online Legal Search - sooper kanoon.com

Source: sooperkanoon.com/act/46137

Finance Act, 1984

Chapter V - Miscellaneous

In the Unit Trust of India Act, 1963, in sub-section (1) of section 32, with effect from the 1st day of
April, 1985, -

(@) clause (b) and clause (ba) shall be omitted;
(b) in Explanation 1, -

() in clause (a), for the words, brackets and letters "clauses (aa) and (b)", the word, brackets
and letters "clause (aa)" shall be substituted;

(i) in clause (b), for the words, brackets and letters "clauses (ba) and (bb)", the word, brackets
and letters "clause (bb)" shall be substituted.

Section 55 - Amendment Of Act 45 Of 1968

In the Gold (Control) Act, 1968, -

(@) In sub-section (2) of section 81B, for the words "ten thousand rupees’, the words "fifty
thousand rupees” shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-section (3) of section 82, for the words "two years', the words "one year" shall be
substituted.

Sooper Kanoon - India’'s Premier Online L egal Sear ch - sooper kanoon.com


https://sooperkanoon.com/
https://sooperkanoon.com/act/46137

