SooperKanoon - India's Premier Online Legal Search ( sooperkanoon.com)
Source : sooperkanoon.com/act/4213/
Finance Act, 1992

Chapter III - Direct Taxes Income-tax

In section 2 of the Income-tax Act, -

(a) in clause (18), after sub-clause (ac), the following sub-clause shall be inserted with effect from the 1st day of April,
1993, namely :-

"(ad) if it is a company, wherein shares (not being shares entitled to a fixed rate of dividend whether with or
without a further right to participate in profits) carrying not less than fifty per cent. of the voting power have been
allotted unconditionally to, or acquired unconditionally by, and were throughout the relevant previous year
beneficially held by, one or more co-operative societies;";

(b) in clause (24), after sub-clause (vd), the following sub-clause shall be inserted with effect from the 1st day of April,
1993, namely :-

"(ve) any sum chargeable to income-tax under clause (v) of section 28;";

(c) in clause (37A), for sub-clause (iii), the following sub-clause shall be substituted with effect from the 1st day of June,
1992, namely :-

"(iii) for the purposes of deduction of tax under section 195, the rate or rates of income-tax specified in this behalf in
the Finance Act of the relevant year or the rate or rates of income-tax specified in an agreement entered into by the
Central Government under section 90, whichever is applicable by virtue of the provisions of section 90;";

(d) clause (39) shall be omitted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993;

(e) clause (48) shall be omitted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993.
Section 4 - Amendment Of Section 10

In section 10 of the Income-tax Act, -
(a) after clause (2), the following clause shall be inserted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993, namely :-

"(2A) in the case of a person being a partner of a firm which is separately assessed as such, his share in the total
income of the firm.

Explanation : For the purposes of this clause, the share of a partner in the total income of a firm separately
assessed as such shall, notwithstanding anything contained in any other law, be an amount which bears to the
total income of the firm the same proportion as the amount of his share in the profits of the firm in accordance
with the partnership deed bears to such profits;";

(b) in clause (3), in the proviso, -
(1) for the words "Provided that", the following shall be substituted, namely :-

'Provided that where such receipts relate to winnings from races including horse races, the provisions of this
clause shall have effect as if for the words "five thousand rupees", the words "two thousand five hundred rupees”
had been substituted :

Provided further that’;
(ii) in clause (iii), the words "or", occurring at the end, shall be omitted;
(iii) clause (iv) shall be omitted,;

(c) in clause (6), in sub-clause (viia), with effect from the 1st day of June, 1992, -

(a) for the portion beginning with the words "the following conditions are fulfilled, namely, that -" and ending with
the words "six months of such commencement”, the following shall be substituted, namely :-

"the individual was not resident in India in any of the four financial years immediately preceding the financial


https://sooperkanoon.com/act/4213

year in which he arrived in India,";
(b) the first proviso shall be omitted;
(c) in the second proviso, -
(i) the word "further" shall be omitted;

(ii) for the words, brackets and figure "condition specified in item (1) of", the words "condition relating to non-
residence in India as specified in" shall be substituted;

(d) in clause (6A), for the words "and approved by the Central Government, the tax on such income is payable, under
the terms of such agreement, by Government or the Indian concern to the Central Government, the tax so paid", the
following shall be substituted with effect from the 1st day of June, 1992, namely :-

"and, -

(a) where the agreement relates to a matter included in the industrial policy, for the time being in force, of the
Government of India, such agreement is in accordance with that policy; and

(b) in any other case, the agreement is approved by the Central Government,

the tax on such income is payable, under the terms of the agreement, by Government or the Indian concern to the
Central Government, the tax so paid";

(e) after clause (10B), the following clause shall be inserted, namely :-

"(10BB) any payments made under the Bhopal Gas Leak Disaster (Processing of Claims) Act, 1985 (21 of 1985) and
any scheme framed thereunder except payment made to any assessee in connection with the Bhopal gas leak
disaster to the extent such assessee has been allowed a deduction under this Act on account of any loss or damage
caused to him by such disaster;";

(D) for clause (10C), the following clause shall be substituted, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993, namely :-

"(10C) any amount received by an employee of a public sector company or of any other company at the time of his
voluntary retirement in accordance with any scheme or schemes of voluntary retirement :

Provided that the schemes of the said companies governing the payment of such amount are framed in
accordance with such guidelines as may be prescribed for the public sector companies or for other companies
and such guidelines may, inter alia, include criteria of economic viability and such schemes in relation to
companies (other than public sector companies) are approved by the Chief Commissioner or, as the case may be,
Director-General in this behalf;";

(g) in clause (15), in sub-clause (iv), in item (d), after the words and figures "National Housing Bank Act, 1987 (53 of
1987),", the words and figures "or the Small Industries Development Bank of India established under section 3 of the
Small Industries Development Bank of India Act, 1989 (39 of 1989)," shall be inserted;

(h) in clause (21), for clause (b) of the first proviso, the following clause shall be substituted and shall be deemed to
have been substituted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1990, namely :-

"(b) does not invest or deposit its funds, other than -

(i) any assets held by the scientific research association where such assets form part of the corpus of the fund of
the association as on the 1st day of June, 1973;

(i) any assets (being debentures issued by, or on behalf of, any company or corporation), acquired by the
scientific research association before the 1st day of March, 1983;

(iii) any accretion to the shares, forming part of the corpus of the fund mentioned in sub-clause (i), by way of
bonus shares allotted to the scientific research association;

(iv) voluntary contributions received and maintained in the form of jewellery, furniture or any other article as
the Board may, by notification in the Official Gazette, specify,

for any period during the previous year otherwise than in any one or more of the forms or modes specified in sub-
section (5) of section 11 :";

(1) in clause (23), -

(1) for clause (b) of the third proviso, the following clause shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been
substituted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1990, namely :-

"(b) does not invest or deposit its funds, other than -

(i) any assets held by the association or institution where such assets form part of the corpus of the fund of the
association or institution as on the 1st day of June, 1973;



(ii) any assets (being debentures issued by, or on behalf of, any company or corporation), acquired by the
association or institution before the 1st day of March, 1983;

(iii) any accretion to the shares, forming part of the corpus of the fund mentioned in sub-clause (i), by way of
bonus shares allotted to the association or institution;

(iv) voluntary contributions received and maintained in the form of jewellery, furniture or any other article as
the Board may, by notification in the Official Gazette, specify,

for any period during the previous year otherwise than in any one or more of the forms or modes specified in
sub-section (5) of section 11; and";

(2) in the fourth proviso, for the figures "1992", the figures "1993" shall be substituted;
(j) in clause (230), -

(1) for clause (b) of the third proviso, the following clause shall be substituted and shall be deemed to have been
substituted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1990, namely :-

"(b) does not invest or deposit its funds, other than -

(i) any assets held by the fund, trust or institution where such assets form part of the corpus of the fund, trust or
institution as on the 1st day of June, 1973;

(ii) any assets (being debentures issued by, or on behalf of, any company or corporation), acquired by the fund,
trust or institution before the 1st day of March, 1983;

(iii) any accretion to the shares, forming part of the corpus mentioned in sub-clause (i), by way of bonus shares
allotted to the fund, trust or institution;

(iv) voluntary contributions received and maintained in the form of jewellery, furniture or any other article as
the Board may, by notification in the Official Gazette, specify,

for any period during the previous year otherwise than in any one or more of the forms or modes specified in
sub-section (5) of section 11;";

(2) in the fourth proviso, for the figures "1992", the figures "1993" shall be substituted;

(k) in clause (23D), with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993, -

(1) after the words "public financial institution", the words "or authorised by the Securities and Exchange Board of
India or the Reserve Bank of India" shall be inserted;

(i) in the Explanation, after clause (b), the following clause shall be inserted, namely :-

'(c) the expression "Securities and Exchange Board of India" shall have the meaning assigned to it in clause (a) of
sub-section (1) of section 2 of the Securities and Exchange Board of India Act, 1992 (15 of 1992);';

(D after clause (26B), the following clause shall be inserted and shall be deemed to have been inserted with effect from
the 1st day of April, 1989, namely :-

"(27) any income of a co-operative society formed for promoting the interests of the members of either the
Scheduled Castes or Scheduled Tribes or both referred to in clause (26B) :

Provided that the membership of the co-operative society consists of only other co-operative societies formed for
similar purposes and the finances of the society are provided by the Government and such other societies;";

(m) after clause (31), the following clause shall be inserted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993, namely :-

"(32) in the case of an assessee referred to in sub-section (1A) of section 64, any income includible in his total income
under that sub-section, to the extent such income does not exceed one thousand five hundred rupees in respect of
each minor child whose income is so includible.".

Section 5 - Amendment Of Section 13

In section 13 of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1), in clause (d), in the proviso, -

(1) in clause (i), the words "and such assets were not purchased by the trust or institution or acquired by it by
conversation of, or in exchange for, any other asset" shall be omitted and shall be deemed to have been omitted with
effect from the 1st day of April, 1983;

(i) after clause (i), the following clause shall be inserted and shall be deemed to have been inserted with effect from
the 1st day of April, 1983, namely :-

"(ia) any accretion to the shares, forming part of the corpus mentioned in clause (i), by way of bonus shares allotted



to the trust or institution;";

(iii) in clause (iia), for the figures "1992", the figures "1993" shall be substituted.
Section 6 - Amendment Of Section 15

In section 15 of the Income-tax Act, the Explanation shall be renumbered as Explanation 1, and after Explanation 1 as so
renumbered, the following Explanation shall be inserted with from the 1st day of April, 1993, namely :-

'Explanation 2 : Any salary, bonus, commission or remuneration, by whatever name called, due to, or received by, a
partner of a firm from the firm shall not be regarded as "salary" for the purposes of this section.'.

Section 7 - Amendment Of Section 16

In section 16 of the Income-tax Act, in clause (i), before the Explanation, the following proviso shall be inserted with effect
from the 1st day of April, 1993, namely :-

'Provided that in the case of an assessee, being a woman, whose total income before making any deduction under this
clause does not exceed seventy-five thousand rupees, the provisions of this clause shall have effect as if for the words
"twelve thousand rupees”, the words "fifteen thousand rupees" had been substituted.'.

Section 8 - Amendment Of Section 17

In section 17 of the Income-tax Act, in clause (2), with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993, -
(1) in the proviso, -

(a) for clause (ii), the following clause shall be substituted, namely :-
"(ii) any sum paid by the employer -
(a) in respect of any expenditure actually incurred by the employee on his medical treatment or treatment of any
member of his family in any hospital maintained by the Government or any local authority or any other hospital
approved by the Government for the purposes of medical treatment of its employees;
(b) directly to a hospital, approved by the Chief Commissioner having regard to the prescribed guidelines for the
purposes of medical treatment of the prescribed diseases or ailments, on account of such treatment of the
employee or any member of his family;";

(b) in clause (vi), for the words "one lakh rupees”, the words "two lakh rupees" shall be substituted;

(2) in the Explanation, in clause (i), after the words "or a clinic", the words "or a nursing home" shall be inserted.

Section 9 - Amendment Of Section 23

In section 23 of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1), in clause (d) of the second proviso, after the figures, letters and
words "31st day of March, 1982", the words, figures and letters "but before the 1st day of April, 1992" shall be inserted with
effect from the 1st day of April, 1993.

Section 10 - Amendment Of Section 24

In section 24 of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1), with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993, -
(a) for clause (i), the following clause shall be substituted, namely :-
"(1) in respect of repairs of, and collection of rent from, the property, a sum equal to one-fifth of the annual value;";

(b) clause (viii) shall be omitted.
Section 11 - Amendment Of Section 28

In section 28 of the Income-tax Act, after clause (iv), the following clause shall be inserted with effect from the 1st day of
April, 1993, namely :-

"(v) any interet, salary, bonus, commission or remuneration, by whatever name called, due to, or received by, a partner
of a firm from such firm :

Provided that where any interest, salary, bonus, commission or remuneration, by whatever name called, or any



part thereof has not been allowed to be deducted under clause (b) of section 40, the income under this clause shall
be adjusted to the extent of the amount not so allowed to be deducted.".

Section 12 - Amendment Of Section 33AC

In section 33AC of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993, -
(a) in sub-section (1), after the words "an assessee, being", the words "a Government company or" shall be inserted;
(b) in the Explanation, after clause (a), the following clause shall be inserted, namely :-

'(aa) "Government company" shall have the meaning assigned to it in section 617 of the Companies Act, 1956 (1 of
1956);".

Section 13 - Insertion Of New Section 34A

After section 34 of the Income-tax Act, the following section shall be inserted, namely :-

"34A. Restriction on unabsorbed depreciation and unabsorbed investment allowance for limited period in case of
certain domestic companies. -

(1) In computing the profits and gains of the business of a domestic company in relation to the previous year
relevant to the assessment year commencing on the 1st day of April, 1992, where effect is to be given to the
unabsorbed depreciation allowance or unabsorbed investment allowance or both in relation to any previous year
relevant to the assessment year commencing on or before the 1st day of April, 1991, the deduction shall be
restricted to two-thirds of such allowance or allowances and the balance, -

(a) where it relates to depreciation allowance, be added to the depreciation allowance for the previous year
relevant to the assessment year commencing on the 1st day of April, 1993, and be deemed to be part of that
allowance or if there is no such allowance for that previous year, be deemed to be the allowance for that
previous year and so on for the succeeding previous years;

(b) where it relates to investment allowance, be carried forward to the assessment year commencing on the 1st
day of April, 1993, and the balance of the investment allowance, if any, still outstanding shall be carried forward
to the following assessment year and where the period of eight years has expired before the portion of such
balance is adjusted, the said period shall be extended beyond eight years till such time the portion of the said
balance is absorbed in the profits and gains of the business of the domestic company.

(2) For the assessment year commencing on the 1st day of April, 1992, the provisions of sub-section (2) of section 32
and sub-section (3) of section 32A shall apply to the extent such provisions are not inconsistent with the provisions
of sub-section (1) of this section.

(3) Nothing contained in sub-section (1) shall apply where the amount of unabsorbed depreciation allowance or of
the unabsorbed investment allowance, as the case may be, or the aggregate amount of such allowances in the case
of a domestic company is less than one lakh rupees.

(4) Nothing contained in sections 234B and 234C shall apply to anﬁl shortfall in the payment of any tax due on the
assessed tax or, as the case may be, returned income where such shortfall is on account of restricting the amount of

depreciation allowance or investment allowance under this section and the assessee has paid the amount of
shortfall before furnishing the return of income under sub-section (1) of section 139.".

Section 14 - Amendment Of Section 36

In section 36 of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1), in clause (viii), for the Explanation, the following Explanation shall
be substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1987, namely :-

'Explanation : In this clause, -
(a) "financial corporation” shall include a public company and a Government company;
(b) "public company" shall have the meaning assigned to it in section 3 of the Companies Act, 1956 (1 of 1956);

(c) "Government company" shall have the meaning assigned to it in section 617 of the Companies Act, 1956 (1 of
1956).".

Section 15 - Amendment Of Section 37

In section 37 of the Income-tax Act, for sub-sections (2) and (2A), the following sub-section shall be substituted with effect
from the 1st day of April, 1993, namely :-

'(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1), any expenditure in the nature of entertainment
expenditure incurred by any assessee during any previous year commencing on the 1st day of April, 1992 shall be



allowed as follows :-

(a) where the amount of such expenditure does not exceed ten thousand rupees, the whole of such amount;

(b) in any other case, ten thousand rupees as increased by a sum equal to fifty per cent. of such expenditure in
excess of ten thousand rupees.

Explanation : For the purposes of this sub-section, "entertainment expenditure” includes -

(i) the amount of any allowance in the nature of entertainment allowance paid by the assessee to any employee
or other person;

(ii) the amount of any expenditure in the nature of entertainment expenditure [not being expenditure incurred
out of an allowance of the nature referred to in clause (i)] incurred for the purposes of the business or profession
of the assessee by any employee or other person;

(iii) expenditure on provision of hospitalitﬁ of every kind by the assessee to any person, whether by way of
Erovision of food or beverages or in any other manner whatsoever and whether or not such provision is made

y reson of any express or implied contract or custom or usage of trade, but does not include expenditure on
food or beverages provided by the assessee to his employees in office, factory or other place of their work.'.

Section 16 - Amendment Of Section 40

In section 40 of the Income-tax Act, for clause (b), the following clause shall be substituted with effect from the 1st day of

April, 1993, namely :-

'(b) in the case of any firm assessable as such, -

(i) any payment of salary, bonus, commission or remuneration, by whatever name called (hereinafter referred to as
remuneration) to any partner who is not a working partner; or

(ii) any payment of remuneration to any partner who is a working partner, or of interest to any partner, which, in
either case, is not authorised by, or is not in accordance with, the terms of the partnership deed; or

(iii) any payment of remuneration to any partner who is a working partner, or of interest to any partner, which, in
either case, is authorised by, and is in accordance with, the terms of the partnership deed, but which relates to any
period (falling prior to the date of such partnership deed) for which such payment was not authorised by, or is not
in accordance with, any earlier partnership deed, so, however, that the period of authorisation for such payment by
any earlier partnership deed does not cover any period prior to the date of such earlier partnership deed; or

(iv) any payment of interest to any partner which is authorised by, and is in accordance with, the terms of the
partnership deed and relates to any period falling after the date of such partnership deed insofar as such amount
exceeds the amount calculated at the rate of eighteen per cent. simple interest per annum; or

(v) any payment of remuneration to any partner who is a working partner, which is authorised by, and is in
accordance with, the terms of the partnership deed and relates to any period falling after the date of such
partnership deed in so far as the amount of such payment to all the partners during the previous year exceeds the
aggregate amount computed as hereunder :-

(1) in case of a firm carrying on a profession referred to in section 44AA or which is
notified for the purpose of that section -

(a) on the first Rs. 1,00,000 of the book-profit or in case of a loss book-profit, whichever
is more;

Rs. 50,000 or at the rate of 90 per cent.
of the

(b) on the next Rs. 1,00,000 of the book-profit

at the rate of 60 per cent.;

(c) on the balance of the book-profit

at the rate of 40 per cent.;

(2) in the case of any other firm -

(a) on the first Rs. 75,000 of the book-profit or in case of a loss whichever is more;

Rs. 50,000 or at the rate of 90 per cent.
of the book-profit,

(b) on the next Rs. 75,000 of the book-profit

at the rate of 60 per cent.;

(c) on the balance of the book-profit

at the rate of 40 per cent. :

Provided that in relation to any payment under this clause to the partner during the previous year relevant to
the assessment year commencing on the 1st day of April, 1993, the terms of the partnership deed may, at any
time during the said previous year, provide for such payment.

Explanation 1 : Where an individual is a partner in a firm on behalf, or for the benefit, of any other person (such
partner and the other person being hereinafter referred to as "partner in a representative capacity” and "person
so represented", respectively), -

(i) interest paid by the firm to such individual otherwise than as partner in a representative capacity, shall not
be taken into account for the purposes of this clause;



(ii) interest paid by the firm to such individual as partner in a representative caﬁacity and interest paid by the
firm to the person so represented shall be taken into account for the purposes of this clause.

Explanation 2 : For the purposes of this clause, "book-profit" means than as partner in a representative capacity,
interest paid by the firm to such individual shall not be taken into account for the purposes of this clause, if suc
interest 1s received by him on behalf, or for the benefit, of any other person.

Explanation 3 : For the purposes of this clause, "book-profit" means the net profit, as shown in the profit and loss
account for the relevant previous year computed in the manner laid down in Chapter IV-D as increased by the
aggregate amount of the remuneration paid or payable to all the partners of the firm if such amount has been
deducted while computing the net profit.

Explanation 4 : For the purposes of this clause, "working partner" means an individual who is actively engaged
in conducting the affairs of the business or profession of the firm of which he is a partner;'.

Section 17 - Amendment Of Section 40A
In section 40A of the Income-tax Act, sub-section (12) shall be omitted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993.
Section 18 - Amendment Of Section 41

In section 41 of the Income-tax Act, for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be substituted, with effect from the
1st day of April, 1993, namely :-

'(1) where an allowance or deduction has been made in the assessment for any year in respect of loss, expenditure or
trading liability incurred by the assessee (hereinafter referred to as the first-mentioned person) and subsequently
during any previous year, -

(a) the first-mentioned person has obtained, whether in cash or in any other manner whatsoever, any amount in
respect of such loss or expenditure or some benefit in respect of such trading liability by way of remission or
cessation thereof, the amount obtained by such person or the value of benefit accruing to him shall be deemed to be
profits and gains of business or profession and accordingly chargeable to income-tax as the income of that previous
year, whether the business or profession in respect of which the allowance or deduction has been made is in
existence in that year or not; or

(b) the successor in business has obtained, whether in cash or in any other manner whatsoever, any amount in
respect of which loss or expenditure was incurred by the first-mentioned person or some benefit in respect of the
trading liability referred to in clause (a) by way of remission or cessation thereof, the amount obtained by the
successor in business or the value of benefit accruing to the successor in business shall be deemed to be profits and
gains of the business or profession, and accordingly chargeable to income-tax as the income of that previous year.

Explanation : For the purposes of this sub-section, "successor in business" means -

(i) where there has been an amalgamation of a company with another company, the amalgamated company;

(ii) where the first-mentioned person is succeeded by any other person in that business or profession, the other
person;

(iii) where a firm carrying on a business or profession is succeeded by another firm, the other firm.'.

Section 19 - Amendment Of Section 44AA

In section 44AA of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (2), with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993, -

(a) for the words "twenty-five thousand", at both the places where they occur, the words "forty thousand" shall be
substituted;

(b) for the words "two hundred and fifty thousand", at both the places where they occur, the words "five hundred
thousand" shall be substituted.

Section 20 - Amendment Of Section 44AB

In section 44AB of the Income-tax Act, in the proviso, for the words "Provided that", the following shall be substituted and
shall be deemed to have been substituted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1985, namely :-

"Provided that this section shall not apply to the person, who derives income of the nature referred to in section 44AC
or section 44B or section 44BB or section 44BBA or section 44BBB, on and from the 1st day of April, 1985 or, as the case
may be, the date on which the relevant section came into force, whichever is later :



Provided further that".
Section 21 - Omission Of Section 44AC
Section 44AC of the Income-tax Act shall be omitted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993.
Section 22 - Amendment Of Section 45
In section 45 of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1), the figures "53", shall be omitted with from the 1st day of April, 1993.
Section 23 - Amendment Of Section 47

In section 47 of the Income-tax Act, -
(a) after clause (vi), the following clause shall be inserted, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993, namely :-

"(via) any transfer, in a scheme of amalgamation, of a capital asset being a share or shares held in an Indian
company, by the amalgamating foreign company to the amalgamated foreign company, if -

(a) at least twenty-five per cent. of the shareholders of the amalgamating foreign company continue to remain
shareholders of the amalgamated foreign company, and

(b) such transfer does not attract tax on capital gains in the country, in which the amalgamating company is
incorporated;";

(b) after clause (vii), the following clause shall be inserted, with effect from the 1st day of June, 1992, namely :-

"(viia) any transfer of a capital asset, being bonds or shares referred to in sub-section (1) of section 115AC, made
outside India by a non-resident to another non-resident;";

(c) in clause (x), for the words "conversion of debentures", the words "conversion of bonds or debentures" shall be
substituted and shall be deemed to have been substituted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1962.

Section 24 - Substitution Of New Section For Section 48

For section 48 of the Income-tax Act, the following section shall be substituted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993,
namely :-

48. Mode of computation. - The income chargeable under the head "CaPital gains" shall be computed, by deducting
from the full value of the consideration received or accruing as a result of the transfer of the capital asset the following
amounts, namely :-

(1) expenditure incurred wholly and exclusively in connection with such transfer;
(ii) the cost of acquisition of the asset and the cost of any improvement thereto :

Provided that in the case of an assessee, who is a non-resident, capital gains arising from the transfer of a capital
asset being shares in, or debentures of, an Indian company shall be computed by converting the cost of
acquisition, expenditure incurred wholly and exclusively in connection with such transfer and the full value of
the consideration received or accruing as a result of the transfer of the capital asset into the same foreign
currency as was initially utilised in the purchase of the shares or debentures, and the capital gains so computed
in such foreign currency shall be reconverted into Indian currency, so however, that the aforesaid manner of
computation of capital gains shall be applicable in respect of capital gains accruing or arising from every
reinvestment thereafter in, and sale of, shares in, or debentures of, an Indian company :

Provided further that where long-term capital gain arises from the transfer of a long-term capital asset, other
than capital gain arising to a non-resident from the transfer of shares in, or debentures of, an Indian company
referred to iIn the first proviso, the provisions of clause (ii) shall have effect as if for the words "cost of
acquisition" and "cost of any improvement", the words "indexed cost of acquisition" and "indexed cost of any
improvement" had respectively been substituted.

Explanation : For the purposes of this section, -

(i) "foreign currency" and "Indian currency" shall have the meanings respectively assigned to them in section 2
of the Foreign Exchange Regulation Act, 1973 (46 of 1973);

(ii) the conversion of India currency into foreign currency and the reconversion of foreign currency into Indian
currency shall be at the rate of exchange prescribed in this behalf;

(iii) "indexed cost of acquisition" means an amount which bears to the cost of acquisition the same proportion as
Cost Inflation Index for the year in which the asset is transferred bears to the Cost Inflation Index for the first
year in which the asset was held by the assessee or for the year beginning on the 1st day of April, 1981,
whichever is later;

(iv) "indexed cost of any improvement” means an amount which bears to the cost of improvement the same
proportion as Cost Inflation Index for the year in which the asset is transferred bears to the Cost Inflation Index



for the year in which the improvement to the asset book place;

(v) "Cost Inflation Index" for any year means such Index as the Central Government may, having regard to
seventy-five per cent. of average rise in the Consumer Price Index for urban non-manual employees for that
year, by notification in the Official Gazette, specify in this behalf.".

Section 25 - Amendment Of Section 49

In section 49 of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1), in clause (iii), in sub-clause (e), after the word, brackets and figures
"clause (vi)", the words, brackets, figures and letter "or clause (via)" shall be inserted with effect from the 1st day of April,
1993.

Section 26 - Omission Of Section 53
Section 53 of the Income-tax Act shall be omitted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993.
Section 27 - Amendment Of Section 54

In section 54 of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (2), the Explanation shall be omitted with the effect from the 1st day of
April, 1993.

Section 28 - Amendment Of Section 54B

In section 54B of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (2), the Explanation shall be omitted with effect from the 1st day of
April, 1993.

Section 29 - Amendment Of Section 54D

In section 54D of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (2), the Explanation shall be omitted with effect from the 1st day of
April, 1993.

Section 30 - Amendment Of Section 54E

In section 54E of the Income-tax Act, -
(i) in sub-section (1), -

@ afteg1 the words "long-term capital asset", the words, figures and letters "before the 1st day of April, 1992" shall be
inserted;

(b) in the second proviso, the words, figures and letters "or the 31st day of March, 1992, whichever is earlier" shall
be inserted at the end;

(i) after sub-section (1B), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely :-

"(1C) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1), where the capital gain arises from the transfer of the
original asset, made after the 31st day of March, 1992, in respect of which the assessee had received any amount by
way of advance on or before the 29th day of February, 1992, and had invested or deposited the whole or any part of
such amount in the new asset on or before the later date, then, the provisions of clauses (a) and (b) of sub-section (1)
shall apply in the case of such investment or deposit as they apply in the case of investment or deposit under that
sub-section.”

Section 31 - Amendment Of Section 54F

In section 54F of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (4), the Explanation shall be omitted with effect from the 1st day of
April, 1993.

Section 32 - Amendment Of Section 54G

In section 54G of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (2), the Explanation shall be omitted with effect from the 1st day of
April, 1993.

Section 33 - Amendment Of Section 54H



In section 54H of the Income-tax Act, the figures and letter ", 54E" shall be omitted.
Section 34 - Amendment Of Section 55

In section 55 of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993, -
(a) in sub-section (1), in clause (b), in sub-clause (2), in item (i), -
(1) for the figures "1974", the figures "1981" shall be substituted;

(ii) the words "and the fair market value of the asset on that day is taken as the cost of acquisition at the option of
the assessee," shall be omitted;

(b) in sub-section (2), in clause (b), for the figures "1974", wherever they occur, the figures "1981" shall be substituted.
Section 35 - Amendment Of Section 64

In section 64 of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993, -
(a) in sub-section (1), -
(i) clause (i) shall be omitted,;
(ii) clauses (iii) and (v) shall be omitted;

(iii) in clause (iv), the words, brackets and figure "in a case not falling under clause (i) of this sub-section" shall be
omitted;

(iv) in clause (vi), the words "or son's minor child,", wherever they occur, shall be omitted;
(v) in clause (vii), the words "or minor child or both" shall be omitted;

(vi) in clause (viii), the words "or son's minor child or both" shall be omitted;

(vii) for Explanations 1 and 1A, the following Explanation shall be substituted, namely :-

"Explanation 1 : For the purposes of clause (ii), the individual in computing whose total income the income
referred to in that clause is to be included, shall be the husband or wife whose total income (excluding the
income referred to in that clause) is greater; and where any such income is once included in the total income of
either spouse, any such income arising in any succeeding year shall not be included in the total income of the
other spouse unless the Assessing Officer is satisfied, after giving that spouse an opportunity of being heard, that
it is necessary so to do.";

(viii) Explanation 2A shall be omitted;
(ix) for Explanation 3, the following Explanation shall be substituted, namely :-

'Explanation 3 : For the purposes of clauses (iv) and (vi), where the assets transferred directly or indirectly by an
individual to his spouse or son's wife (hereafter in this Explanation referred to as "the transferee") are invested
by the transferee, -

(1) in any business, such investment being not in the nature of contribution of capital as a partner in a firm or, as
the case may be, for being admitted to the benefits of partnership in a firm, that part of the income arising out of
the business to the transferee in any previous year, which bears the same proportion to the income of the
transferee from the business as the value of the assets aforesaid as on the first day of the previous year bears to
the total investment in the business by the transferee as on the said day;

(ii) in the nature of contribution of capital as a partner in a firm, that part of the interest receivable by the
transferee from the firm in any previous year, which bears the same proportion to the interest receivable by the
transferee from the firm as the value on investment aforesaid as on the first day of the previous year bears to
the total investment by way of capital contribution as a partner in the firm as on the said day,

shall be included in the total income of the individual in that previous year.’;

(b) after sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely :-

"(1A) In computing the total income of any individual, there shall be included all such income as arises or accrues to
his minor child :



Provided that nothing contained in this sub-section shall apply in respect of such income as arises or accrues to
the minor child on account of any -

(a) manual work done by him; or
(b) activity involving application of his skill, talent or specialised knowledge and experience.
Explanation : For the purposes of this sub-section, the income of the minor child shall be included, -

(a) where the marriage of his parents subsists, in the income of that parent whose total income (excluding the
income includible under this sub-section) is greater; or

(b) where the marriage of his parents does not subsist, in the income of that parent who maintains the minor
child in the previous year,

and where any such income is once included in the total income of either parent, any such income arising in any
succeeding year shall not be included in the total income of the other parent, unless the Assessing Officer is
satisfied, after giving that parent an opportunity of being heard, that it is necessary so to do.";

(c) in sub-section (2), the words "or minor child", wherever they occur, shall be omitted.
Section 36 - Omission Of Section 67
Section 67 of the Income-tax Act shall be omitted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993.
Section 37 - Amendment Of Section 71

In section 71 of the Income-tax Act, after sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be inserted, with effect from the
1st day of April, 1993, namely :-

'(4) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-sections (1) and (2), where in respect of any assessment year the net
result of the computation, in relation to any property [other than the property referred to in sub-clause (i) of clause (a)
of sub-section (2) of section 23], under the head "Income from house property" is a loss and the assessee has income
assessable under any other head of income, the assessee shall not be entitled to have such loss set off against income
under the other head.".

Section 38 - Insertion Of New Section 71A

After section 71 of the Income-tax Act, the following section shall be inserted, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993,
namely :-

'"71A. Carry forward of losses under the head "Income from house property". - Where in respect of any assessment year,
the net result of the computation under the head "Income from house property" is a loss, the loss in so far as it relates
to interest on borrowed capital referred to in clause (vi) of sub-section (1) of section 24 shall be carried forward by the
assessee to the following assessment year or years and set off against the income under that head.".

Section 39 - Substitution Of New Section For Sections 75, 76 And 77

For sections 75, 76 and 77 of the Income-tax Act, the following section shall be substituted, with effect from the 1st day of
April, 1993, namely :-

"75. Losses of firms. - Where the assessee is a firm, any loss in relation to the assessment year commencing on or before
the 1st day of April, 1992, which could not set off against any other income of the firm and which had been
apportioned to a partner of the firm but could not be set off by such partner prior to the assessment year commencing
on the 1st day of April, 1993, then, such loss shall be allowed to set off against the income of the firm subject to the
condition that the partner continues in the said firm and to be carried forward for set off under sections 70, 71, 72, 73,
74 and 74A.".

Section 40 - Amendment Of Section 78

In section 78 of the Income-tax Act, for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be substituted, with effect from the
1st day of April, 1993, namely :-

"(1) Where a change has occurred in the constitution of a firm, nothing in this Chapter shall entitle the firm to have



carried forward and set off so much of the loss proportionate to the share of a retired or deceased partner as exceeds
his share of profits, if any, in the firm in respect of the previous year."

Section 41 - Amendment Of Section 80A

In section 80A of the Income-tax Act, for sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be substituted, with effect from the
1st day of April, 1993, namely :-

"(3) Where, in computing the total income of an association of persons or a body of individuals, any deduction is
admissible under section 80G or section 80GGA or section 80HH or section SOHHA 80HHB or section 8OHHC or section
80HHD or section 80-I or section 80-IA or section 80] or section 80]], no deduction under the same section shall be made
in computing the total income of a member of the association of persons or body of individuals in relation to the share
of such member in the income of the association of persons or body of individuals.".

Section 42 - Amendment Of Section 80CCA

In section 80CCA of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993, -
(a) in sub-section (1), after the proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely :-

"Provided further that no deduction under this sub-section shall be allowed in relation to any amount deposited or
paid under clauses (i) and (ii) on or after the 1st day of April, 1992.";

(b) in sub-section (2), the following proviso shall be inserted at the end, namely :-

"Provided that nothing contained in this sub-section shall apply to any amount received by the assessee on account
of the surrender of the policy in accordance with the terms of the annuity plan of the Life Insurance Corporation
where the assessee elects to surrender before the 1st day of October, 1992, the said annuity plan in respect of which
he had paid any amount under clause (ii) of sub-section (1) before the 1st day of April, 1992.".

Section 43 - Amendment Of Section 80CCB

In section 80CCB of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1), the following proviso shall be inserted at the end, with effect
from the 1st day of April, 1993, namely :-

"Provided that no deduction shall be allowed in relation to any amount invested under this sub-section on or after the
1st day of April, 1992.".

Section 44 - Amendment Of Section 80D

In section 80D of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1), for the words "three thousand rupees”, wherever they occur, the
words "six thousand rupees"” shall be substituted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993.

Section 45 - Amendment Of Section 80DD

In section 80DD of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993, -

(a) in sub-section (1), -
(i) the brackets and figure "(1)" shall be omitted;

(ii) for the words "six thousand rupees", the words "twelve thousand rupees" shall be substituted;

(b) sub-section (2) shall be omitted.
Section 46 - Amendment Of Section SOHHC

In section SOHHC of the Income-tax Act, -

(a) in sub-section (1), in the proviso, for the words "total profits of the export business of the assessee the same
proportion as the amount of export turnover specified in the said certificate bears to the total export turnover of the
assessee", the words "total profits derived by the assessee from the export of trading goods, the same proportion as the
amount of export turnover specified in the said certificate bears to the total export turnover of the assessee in respect
of such trading goods" shall be substituted;



(b) in sub-section (3), for the words "manufactured by the assessee"”, wherever they occur, the words "manufactured or
processed by the assessee" shall be substituted.

Section 47 - Amendment Of Section 80-IA

In section 80-IA of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (12), for clause (f), the following clause shall be substituted, with
effect from the 1st day of April, 1993, namely :-

'(f) "small-scale industrial undertaking” means an industrial undertaking which is, as on the last day of the previous
year, regarded as a small-scale industrial undertaking under section 11B of the Industries (Development and
Regulation) Act, 1951 (65 of 1951).".

Section 48 - Amendment Of Section SOL

In section 80L of the Income-tax Act, the first and second provisos to sub-section (1) shall be omitted with effect from the
1st day of April, 1993.

Section 49 - Substitution Of New Section For Section 86

For section 86 of the Income-tax Act, the following section shall be substituted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993,
namely :-

"86. Share of member of an association of persons or body individuals in the income of the association or body. -
Where the assessee is a member of an association of persons or body of individuals (other than a company or a co-
operative society or a society registered under the Societies Registration Act, 1860 (21 of 1860) or under any law
corresponding to that Act in force in any part of India), income-tax shall not be payable by the assessee in respect of his
share in the income of the association or body computed in the manner provided in section 67A :

Provided that, -

(a) where the association or body is chargeable to tax on its total income at the maximum marginal rate or any
higher rate under any of the provisions of this Act, the share of a member computed as aforesaid shall not be
included in his total income;

(b) in any other case, the share of a member computed as aforesaid shall form part of his total income :

Provided further that where no income-tax is chargeable on the total income of the association or body, the
share of a member computed as aforesaid shall be chargeable to tax as part of his total income and nothing
contained in this section shall apply to the case.".

Section 50 - Amendment Of Section 87

In section 87 of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993, -

(a) in sub-section (1), for the words, figures and letter "sections 88 and 88A", the words, figures and letters "section 88,
88A and 88B" shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-section (2), after the word, figures and letter "section 88A", the words, figures and letter "or section 88B" shall
be inserted.

Section 51 - Amendment Of Section 88

In section 88 of the Income-tax Act, -
(1) in sub-section (1), the following proviso shall be inserted, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993, namely :-

"Provided that in the case of an individual, whose income, derived from the exercise of his profession as an author,
playwright, artist, musician, actor or sportsman (including an athlete), is twenty-five per cent. or more of his total
income, the provisions of this sub-section shall have effect as if for the words "twenty per cent.”, the words "twenty-
five per cent." had been substituted.';

(ii) in sub-section (2), -

(a) in clause (ii), for the words, brackets, figures and letters "not being an annuity plan referred to in clause (ii) of



sub-section (1) of section 80CCA", the words, brackets, figures and letter "not being an annuity plan referred to in
clause (xiiia)" shall be substituted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993;

(b) in clause (ix), after the words "the Central Government"”, the words "or any such deposit scheme" shall be
inserted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993;

(c) after clause (xiii), the following clauses shall be inserted, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993, namely :-

"(xiiia) to effect or to keep in force a contract for such annuity plan of the Life Insurance Corporation as the
Central Government may, by notification in the Official Gazette, specify;

(xiiib) as subscription, not exceeding ten thousand rupees, to any units of any Mutual Fund notified under clause
(23D) of section 10 or the Unit Trust of India established under the Unit Trust of India Act, 1963 (52 of 1963),
under any plan formulated in accordance with such scheme as the Central Government may, by notification in
the Official Gazette, specify in this behalf;

(xiiic) as a contribution by an individual to any pension fund set up by any Mutual Fund notified under clause
(23D) of section 10, as the Central Government may, by notification in the Official Gazette, specify in this behalf;";

(d) in clause (xiv), after the words "as subscription to any such deposit scheme of", the words ", or as a contribution
to any such pension fund set up by," shall be inserted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993;

(e) in clause (xv), in sub-clause (c), in item (7), after the words "a local authority", the words "or a co-operative
society” shall be inserted;

(iii) in sub-section (6), with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993, -

(a) in clause (i), for the words and brackets "being an author, playwright, artist, musician, actor or sportsman
(including an athlete), fourteen thousand", the words and brackets "whose income derived from the exercise of
his profession as an author, playwright, artist, musician, actor or sportsman (including an athlete), is twenty-five
per cent. or more of his total income, seventeen thousand five hundred" shall be substituted;

(b) in clause (ii), for the words "ten thousand", the words "twelve thousand" shall be substituted.
Section 52 - Insertion Of New Section 88B

After section 88A of the Income-tax Act, the following section shall be inserted, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993,
namely :-

'88B. Rebate of income-tax in case of individuals of sixty-five years and above. - An assessee, being an individual
resident in India, who is of the age of sixty-five years or more at any time during the previous year and whose gross
total income does not exceed fifty thousand rupees, shall be entitled to a deduction from the amount of income-tax (as
computed before allowing the deductions under this Chapter) on his total income with which he is chargeable for any
assessment year, of an amount equal to ten per cent. of such income-tax.

Explanation : For the purposes of this section, "gross total income" means the total income computed in accordance
with the provisions of this Act, before making any deduction under Chapter VI-A.".

Section 53 - Insertion Of New Section 112

After section 111 of the Income-tax Act, the following section shall be inserted, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993,
namely :-

'112. Tax on long-term capital gains. - (1) Where the total income of an assessee includes any income, arising from the
transfer of a long-term capital asset, which is chargeable under the head "Capital gains", the tax payable by the
assessee on the total income shall be the aggregate of, -

(a) in the case of an individual or a Hindu undivided family, -

(i) the amount of income-tax payable on the total income as reduced by the amount of such long-term capital
gains, had the total income as so reduced been his total income; and

(ii) the amount of income-tax calculated on such long-term capital gains at the rate of twenty per cent. :

Provided that where the total income as reduced by such long-term capital gains is below the maximum amount
which is not chargeable to income-tax, then, such long-term capital gains shall be reduced by the amount by
which the total income as so reduced falls short of the maximum amount which is not chargeable to income-tax
and the tax on the balance of such long-term capital gains shall be computed at the rate of twenty per cent.;



(b) in the case of a company, -

(i) the amount of income-tax payable on the total income as reduced by the amount of such long-term capital
gains, had the total income as so reduced been its total income; and

(ii) the amount of income-tax calculated on such long-term capital gains at the rate of forty per cent. :

Provided that in relation to long-term capital gains arising to a venture capital company from the transfer of
equity shares of venture capital undertakings, the provisions of sub-clause (ii) shall have effect as if for the
words "forty per cent.", the words "twenty per cent.” had been substituted;

(c) in any other case, -

(i) the amount of income-tax payable on the total income as reduced by the amount of long-term capital gains,
had the total income as so reduced been its total income; and

(ii) the amount of income-tax calculated on such long-term capital gains at the rate thirty per cent.
Explanation : For the purposes of this sub-section, -

(a) "venture capital company" means such company as is engaged in providing finance to venture capital
undertakings mainly by way of acquiring equity shares of such undertakings or, if the circumstances so require,
by way of advancing loans to such undertakings, and is approved by the Central Government in this behalf;

(b) "venture capital undertaking" means such company as the prescribed authority may, having regard to the
following factors, approve for the purposes of this sub-section, namely :-

(1) the total investment in the company does not exceed ten crore rupees or such other higher amount as may be
prescribed;

(2) the company does not have adequate financial resources to undertake projects for which it is otherwise
professionally or technically equipped; and

(3) the company seeks to employ any technology which will result in significant improvement over the existing
technology in India in any field and the investment in such technology involves high risk.

(2) Where the gross total income of an assessee includes any income arising from the transfer of a long-term capital
asset, the gross total income shall be reduced by the amount of such income and the deduction under Chapter VI-A
shall be allowed as if the gross total income as so reduced were the gross total income of the assessee.

(3) Where the total income of an assessee includes any income arising from the transfer of a long-term capital asset, the
total income shall be reduced by the amount of such income and the rebate under section 88 shall be allowed from the
income-tax on the total income as so reduced.'.

Section 54 - Amendment Of Section 115A

In section 115A of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of June, 1992, -

(a) in sub-section (1), in clause (b), for the words "such agreement is approved by the Central Government", the words
"the agreement is approved by the Central Government or where it relates to a matter included in the industrial policy,
for the time being in force, of the Government of India, the agreement is in accordance with that policy" shall be
substituted,;

(b) in sub-section (1A), for the words "and approved by the Central Government", the words "approved by the Central
Government or where the agreement relates to a matter included in the industrial policy, for the time being in force, of
the Government of India, the agreement is in accordance with that policy" shall be substituted.

Section 55 - Amendment Of Section 115AB

In section 115AB of the Income-tax Act, in the sub-section (2), in clause (a), with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993, -
(i) the words, brackets and figures "or sub-section (2) of section 48" shall be omitted;

(ii) after the word, figures and letter "Chapter VI-A", the words, figures, brackets and letter "and nothing contained in
the provisions of the second proviso to section 48 shall apply to income referred to in clause (b) of sub-section (1)" shall
be inserted.

Section 56 - Insertion Of New Section 115AC



After section 115AB of the Income-tax Act, the following section shall be inserted, with effect from the 1st day of April,
1993, namely :-

"115AC. Tax on income from bonds or shares purchased in foreign currency or capital gains arising from their transfer.
- (1) Where the total income of an assessee, being a non-resident, includes -

(a) income by way of interest or dividends, on bonds or shares of an Indian company issued in accordance with
such scheme as the Central Government may, by notification in the Official Gazette, specify in this behalf, and
purchased by him in foreign currency; or

(b) income by way of long-term capital gains arising from the transfer of bonds or, as the case may be, shares
referred to in clause (a),

the income-tax payable shall be the aggregate of -

(i) the amount of income-tax calculated on the income by way of interest or dividends, as the case may be, in
respect of bonds or shares referred to in clause (a), if any, included in the total income, at the rate of ten per
cent.;

(ii) the amount of income-tax calculated on the income by way of long-term capital gains referred to in clause (b),
if any, at the rate of ten per cent.; and

(i) the amount of income-tax with which the non-resident would have been chargeable had his total income
been reduced by the amount of income referred to in clause (a) and clause (b).

(2) Where the gross total income of the non-resident -

(a) consists only of income by way of interest or dividends in respect of bonds or, as the case may be, shares referred to
in clause (a) of sub-section (1), no deduction shall be allowed to him under sections 28 to 44C or clause (i) or clause (iii)
of section 57 or under Chapter VI-A;

(b) includes any income referred to in clause (a) or clause (b) of sub-section (1) the gross total income shall be reduced
by the amount of such income and the deduction under Chapter VI-A shall be allowed as if the gross total income as so
reduced, were the gross total income of the assessee.

(3) Nothing contained in the first and second provisos to sub-section (1) of section 48 shall apply for the computation of
long-term capital gains arising out of the transfer of long-term capital asset, being bonds or shares referred to in clause (b)
of sub-section (1).

(4) It shall not be necessary for a non-resident to furnish under sub-section (1) of section 139 a return of his income if -

(a) his total income in respect of which he is assessable under this Act during the previous year consisted only of
income referred to in clause (a) of sub-section (1); and

(b) the tax deductible at source under the provisions of Chapter XVII-B has been deducted from such income.".
Section 57 - Amendment Of Section 115D

In section 115D of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (2), in clause (a), for the words, brackets, figures and letter "under
sub-section (2) of section 48 or under Chapter VI-A", the words, figures and letter 'under Chapter VI-A and nothing
contained in the provisions of the second proviso to section 48 shall apply to income chargeable under the head "Capital
gains" shall be substituted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993.

Section 58 - Insertion Of New Chapter XII-C

After Chapter XII-B of the Income-tax Act, the following Chapter shall be inserted, with effect from the 1st day of April,
1993, namely :-

CHAPTER XII-C
Special Provisions Relating To Retail Trade, Etc.

115K. Special provision for computation of income in certain cases. - (1) Notwithstanding anything contained in any
other provision of this Act relating to the computation of income chargeable under the head "Profits and gains of
business or profession”, in the case any person, to whom this section applies, carrying on -



(a) the business of retail trade in any goods or merchandise and who submits a statement in accordance with the
provisions of sub-section (4), a sum equal to seven per cent. of the amount specified in sub-section (5) shall be
deemed to be the profits and gains of such person from the business of retail trade;

(b) the business of running an eating or engaged in any vocation and who submits a statement in accordance with
the provisions of sub-section (4), a sum of thirty-five thousand rupees shall be deemed to be the profits and gains of
such person from such business or vocation.

(2) The provisions of sub-section (1) shall apply to any person, being an individual or a Hindu undivided family, where

(a}) such person has not been assessed to income-tax for any assessment year commencing on or before the 1st day
of April, 1992;

(b) in the case of person referred to in -

(1) clause (a) of sub-section (1), his turnover from the business of retail trade during the relevant previous year
does not exceed five lakh rupees and his income from such business during that year does not exceed thirty-five
thousand rupees;

(i) clause (b) of sub-section (1), his income from the business of running the eating place or from the vocation
during the relevant previous year does not exceed thirty-five thousand rupees; and

(c) such person does not have any income, in excess of five thousand rupees in the aggregate, chargeable to tax from
any source falling under any head of income other than the income from the business of retail trade or from the
business of running the eating place or from the vocation during the relevant previous year.

(3) Any person to whom this section applies shall be liable to pay tax at the rate specified in the Finance Act of the
relevant year for computing advance tax on the income deemed under sub-section (1) and the other income referred to
in clause (c) of sub-section (2).

(4) Every statement referred to in sub-section (1) shall -

(a) be in the prescribed form, contain the name of such person, his address, nature of business or vocation and a
declaration by him that, -

(i) where he is carrying on the business of retail trade, his turnover from such trade during the relevant previous
year does not exceed five lakh rupees and his income from such trade during that year does not exceed thirty-
five thousand rupees;

(ii) where he is carrying on the business of running the eating place or is engaged in the vocation, his income
during the relevant previous year from such business or vocation does not exceed thirty-five thousand rupees;

and such statement shall also be verified in the prescribed manner;

(b) be submitted on or before the 31st day of March of the relevant previous year along with the proof of payment
of the amount of tax referred to in sub-section (3).

(5) In the case of a person who has submitted a statement under clause (a) of sub-section (1), an annual turnover of five
lakh rupees from the retail trade carried on by him during the relevant previous year shall be deemed to be the
amount referred to in that sub-section.

(6) The provisions of this Chapter shall apply in relation to the assessment year commencing on the 1st day of April,
1993, and the 1st day of April, 1994.

Explanation : For the purposes of this section, "vocation" includes tailoring, hair-cutting, clothes' washing, typing,
photo-copying, repair work of any kind and other services of a similar nature.

115L. Return for income not to be filed in certain cases. - Subject to the provisions of section 115N, a person who has
submitted a statement under sub-section (1) of section 115K shall not be required to furnish a return of income under
sub-section (1) of section 139 and the other provisions of Chapter XIV will not apply in his case.

115M. Special provision for disallowance of deductions and rebate of income-tax. - No deduction under Chapter VI-A
(except section 80L) or rebate of income-tax under Chapter VIII shall be allowed in the case of a person who has
submitted a statement under sub-section (1) of section 115K.

115N. Bar of proceedings in certain cases. - No proceeding under any other Chapter of this Act shall be initiated against
any person who has submitted a statement under sub-section (1) of section 115K in respect of his income from retail

trade for the relevant assessment year unless the Deputy Commissioner, in consequence of evidence in his possession,
has reason to believe that the statement furnished by any person under section 115K is nature.'

Section 59 - Amendment Of Section 139
In section 139 of the Income-tax Act, sub-section (1A) shall be omitted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993.
Section 60 - Amendment Of Section 143

In section 143 of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1A), after the words "as a result of an order under", the words,
brackets and figure "sub-section (3) of this section or" shall be inserted and shall be deemed to have been inserted with
effect from the 1st day of April, 1989.



Section 61 - Amendment Of Section 154

In section 154 of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (2), in clause (b), the following proviso shall be inserted at the end,
namely :-

"Provided that the Assessing Officer shall make an amendment for rectifying any mistake, which has been brought to
his notice by the assessee in relation to an intimation referred to in clause (b) of sub-section (1), within a period of
three months from the end of the month in which it is so brought to his notice and if no such amendment is made
within the said period of three months, the assessee may appeal to the Deputy Commissioner (Appeals) or, as the case
may be, Commissioner (Appeals) against such intimation and the provisions of section 246 and section 249 shall have
effect as if the said intimation were an order for the purposes of those sections.".

Section 62 - Amendment Of Section 155

In section 155 of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993, -

(a) In sub-section (1), in the opening paragraph, for the words "Where in respect of any completed assessment of a
partner in a firm", the words, figures and letter "Where, in respect of any completed assessment of a partner in a firm
for the assessment year commencing on the 1st day of April, 1992, or any earlier assessment year", shall be substituted;

(b) after sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely :-

"(1A) Where in respect of any completed assessment of a firm it is found -

(a) on the assessment or reassessment of the firm, or

(b) on any reduction or enhancement made in the income of the firm under this section, section 154, section 250,
section 254, section 260, section 262, section 263 or section 264, or

(c) on any order passed under sub-section (4) of section 245D on the application made by the firm, that any
remuneration to any partner is not deductible under clause (b) of section 40, the Assessing Officer may amend the
order of assessment of the partner with a view to adjusting the income of the partner to the extent of the amount not so
deductible; and the provisions of section 154 shall, so far as may be, apply thereto, the period of four years specified in
sub-section (7) of that section being reckoned from the end of the financial year in which the final order was passed in
the case of the firm."

Section 63 - Amendment Of Section 158

In section 158 of the Income-tax Act, for the words "Whenever a registered firm is assessed", the words, figures and letters
"Whenever, in respect of the assessment year commencing on the 1st day of April, 1992, or any earlier assessment year, a
registered firm is assessed" shall be substituted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993.

Section 64 - Substitution Of Sub-Heading In Chapter XV

In Chapter XV of the Income-tax Act, for the sub-heading "DD. - Association of persons and body of individuals", the
following shall be substituted, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993, namely :-

"DD. - Firms, association of persons and body of individuals

167A. Charge of tax in the case of a firm. - In the case of a firm which is assessable as a firm, tax shall be charged on its
total income at the maximum marginal rate.".

Section 65 - Omission Of Sections 182 And 183
Sections 182 and 183 of the Income-tax Act shall be omitted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993.
Section 66 - Substitution Of New Sections For Sections 184, 185 And 186

For the sub-heading "B. - Registration of firms", occurring before section 184 and for sections 184, 185 and 186 of the
Income-tax Act, the following sections shall be substituted, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993, namely :-

"184. Assessment as a firm. - (1) A firm shall be assessed as a firm for the purposes of this Act, if -

(i) the partnership is evidenced by an instrument; and



(ii) the individual shares of the partners are specified in that instrument.

(2) A certified copy of the instrument of partnership referred to in sub-section (1) shall accompany the return of
income of the firm of the previous year relevant to the assessment year commencing on or after the 1st day of April,
1993, in respect of which assessment as a firm is first sought.
Explanation : For the purposes of this sub-section, the copy of the instrument of Eartnership shall be certified in
writing by all the partners (not being minors) or, where the return is made after the dissolution of the firm, by all
persons (not being minors) who were partners in the firm immediately before its dissolution and by the Iegal
representative of any such partner who is deceased.
(3) Where a firm is assessed as such for any assessment year, it shall be assessed in the same capacity for every
subsequent year if there is no change in the constitution of the firm or the shares of the partners as evidenced by the
instrument of partnership on the basis of which the assessment as a firm was first sought.
(4) Where an%/ such change had taken place in the previous year, the firm shall furnish a certified copy of the revised
instrument of partnership along with the return of income for the assessment year relevant to such previous year and
all the provisions of this section shall apply accordingly.
(5) Notwithstanding anything contained in the foregoing provisions of this section, where, in respect of any assessment
year, there is on the part of a firm any such failure as is mentioned in section 144, the firm shall not be assessed as such

for the said assessment year and, thereupon, the firm shall be assessed in the same manner as an association of
persons, and all the provisions of this Act shall apply accordingly.

185. Assessment when section 184 not complied with. - Where a firm does not comply with the provisions of section
184 for any assessment year, the firm shall be assessed for that assessment year in the same manner as an association
of persons, and all the provisions of this Act shall apply accordingly.".

Section 67 - Amendment Of Section 187

In section 187 of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1), the proviso shall be omitted with effect from the 1st day of April,
1993.

Section 68 - Amendment Of Section 189

In section 189 of the Income-tax Act, the Explanation below sub-section (3) shall be omitted with effect from the 1st day of
April, 1993.

Section 69 - Insertion Of New Section 189A

In Chapter XVI of the Income-tax Act, after section 189, the following section shall be inserted with effect from the 1st day
of April, 1993, namely :-

"189A. Provisions applicable to past assessments of firms. - In relation to the assessment of any firm and its partners for
the assessment year commencing on the 1st day of April, 1992, or any earlier assessment year, the provisions of this
Chapter as they stood immediately before the 1st day of April, 1993, shall continue to apply.".

Section 70 - Amendment Of Section 193

In section 193 of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of June, 1992, -
(a) the first proviso shall be omitted;
(b) in the second proviso, the word "further" shall be omitted;
(c) in Explanation 1, the figure "1" shall be omitted;

(d) Explanation 2 shall be omitted.
Section 71 - Amendment Of Section 194A

In section 194A of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of June, 1992, -
(a) in sub-section (1), the proviso shall be omitted;
(b) sub-section (2) shall be omitted;
(c) in sub-section (3), for clauses (vii) and (viia), the following clause shall be substituted, namely :-

"(vii) to such income credited or paid in respect of deposits with a banking company to which the Banking



Regulation Act, 1949 (10 of 1949), applies (including any bank or banking institution referred to in section 51 of that
Act), or with a co-operative society engaged in carrying on the business of banking (including a co-operative land
mortgage bank or a co-operative land development bank);";

(d) the Explanation occurring at the end shall be omitted.
Section 72 - Amendment Of Section 194C

In section 194C of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1), with effect from the 1st day of June, 1992, -
(a) in clause (e), for the word "society,", the words "society; or" shall be substituted;
(b) after clause (e), the following clauses shall be inserted, namely :-

"(f) any authority, constituted in India by or under any law, engaged either for the purpose of dealing with and
satisfying the need for housing accommodation or for the purpose of planning, development or improvement of
cities, towns and villages, or for both; or

ﬁ) any society registered under the Societies Registration Act, 1860 (21 of 1860), or under any law corresponding to

(
that Act in force in any part of India; or

(h) any trust; or

ang University established or incorporated by or under a Central, State or Provincial Act and an institution declared
to be a University under section 3 of the University Grants Commission Act, 1956 (3 of 1956),".

Section 73 - Amendment Of Section 194G

Section 194G of the Income-tax Act shall be renumbered as sub-section (1) thereof, and after sub-section (1) as so
renumbered, the following sub-sections shall be inserted, with effect from the 1st day of June, 1992, namely :-

"(2) Where the Assessing Officer is satisfied that the total income of any person who is or has been stocking,
distributing, purchasing or selling lottery tickets justifies the deduction of income-tax at any lower rate or no deduction
of income tax, as the case may be, the Assessing Officer shall, on an application made by such person in this behalf,
give to him such certificate as may be appropriate.

(3) Where any such certificate is given, the person responsible for paying the income referred to in sub-section (1)
shall, until such certificate is cancelled by the Assessing Officer, deduct income-tax at the rates specified in such
certificate or deduct no tax, as the case may be.".

Section 74 - Amendment Of Section 194H

In section 194H of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1), after the words, figures and letters "on or after the 1st day of
October, 1991", the words, figures and letters "but before the 1st day of June, 1992" shall be inserted with effect from the
1st day of June, 1992.

Section 75 - Insertion Of New Section 196C

After section 196B of the Income-tax Act, the following section shall be inserted, with effect from the 1st day of June, 1992,
namely :-

"196C. Income from foreign currency bonds or shares of Indian company. - Where any income by way of interest or
dividends is payable in respect of bonds or shares referred to in section 115AC to a non-resident, the person
responsible for making the payment shall, at the time of credit of such income to the account of the payee or at the
time of payment thereof in cash or by the issue of a cheque or draft or by any other mode, whichever is earlier, deduct
income-tax thereon at the rate of ten percent.".

Section 76 - Amendment Of Section 197

In section 197 of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1), for the portion beginning with the words "where, in the case of any
income of any person other than a company" and ending with the words "the Assessing Officer is satisfied", the following
shall be substituted, with effect from the 1st day of June, 1992, namely :-

"where, in the case of any income of any person, income-tax is required to be deducted at the time of credit or, as the
case may be, at the time of payment at the rates in force under the provisions of sections 192, 193, 1944, 194D and 195,



the Assessing Officer is satisfied".
Section 77 - Amendment Of Section 197A

In section 197A of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of June, 1992, namely :-

(a) in sub-section (1), the words, figures and letter "or section 194A", at both the places where they occur, shall be
omitted,;

(b) after sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely :-

"(1A) Notwithstanding anything contained in section 194A, no deduction of tax shall be made under that section in
the case of a person (not being a company or a firm), if such person furnishes to the person responsible for paying
any income of the nature referred to in that section, a declaration in writing in duplicate in the prescribed form and
verified in the prescribed manner to the effect that the tax on his estimated total income of the previous year in
which such income is to be included in computing his total income will be nil.";

(c) in sub-section (2), after the word, brackets and figure "sub-section (1)", at both the places where they occur, the
words, brackets, figure and letter "or sub-section (1A)" shall be inserted.

Section 78 - Amendment Of Sections 198 To 200, 202 To 203A And 205

In sections 198, 199, 200, 202, 203, 203A and 205 of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of June, 1992, for the
words, figures and letter "and section 196B", the words, figures and letters", section 196B and section 196C" shall be
substituted.

Section 79 - Amendment Of Section 206C

In section 206C of the Income-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1992, -
(a) for sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely :-

"(1) Every person, being a seller shall, at the time of debiting of the amount payable by the buyer to the account of
the buyer or at the time of receipt of such amount from the said buyer in cash or by the issue of a cheque or draft or
by any other mode, whichever is earlier, collect from the buyer of any goods of the nature specified in column (2) of
the Table below, a sum equal to the percentage specified in the corresponding entry in column (3) of the said Table,
of such amount as income-tax :

TABLE
S. No. |[Nature of goods Percentage
(1) ) 3)
(1) Alcoholic liquor for human consumption(other than Indian-made foreign liquor) Fifteen per cent.
(ii) Timber obtained under a forest lease Fifteen per cent.
(iii) Timber obtained by any mode other than under a forest lease Five per cent.
(iv) Any other forest produce not being timber Fifteen per cent. :

Provided that where the Assessinﬁ Officer, on an application made by the buyer, gives a certificate in the
?rescribed form that to the best of his belief any of the goods referred to in the aforesaid Table are to be utilised

or the purposes of manufacturing, processing or producing articles or things and not for trading purposes, the
provisions of this sub-section shall not apply so long as the certificate is in force.";

(b) after sub-section (8), the following Explanation shall be inserted, namely :-

'Explanation : For the purposes of this section, -



(a) "buyer" means a person who obtains in any sale, by way of auction, tender or any other mode, goods of the
nature specified in the Table in sub-section (1) or the right to receive any such goods but does not include, -

(i) a public sector company,
(ii) a buyer in the further sale of such goods obtained in pursuance of such sale, or

(iii) a buyer where the goods are not obtained by him by way of auction and where the sale price of such goods
to be sold by the buyer 1s fixed by or under any State Act;

(b) "seller" means the Central Government, a State Government or any local authority or corporation or
authority established by or under a Central, State or Provincial Act, or any company or firm or co-operative
society.'.

Section 80 - Amendment Of Section 211

In section 211 of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1), in the Table, -
(a) for the word "twenty", the word "thirty" shall be substituted;

(b) for the word "fifty", the word "sixty" shall be substituted.
Section 81 - Amendment Of Section 234C

In section 234C of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1), -

(a) for the word "twenty", wherever it occurs, the word "thirty" shall be substituted with effect from the 1st day of June,
1992;

(b) for the word "fifty", wherever it occurs, the word "sixty" shall be substituted with effect from the 1st day of June,
1992;

(c) in the Explanation, after the word "paid", the words "or payable" shall be inserted and shall be deemed to have been
inserted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1989.

Section 82 - Amendment Of Section 239

In section 239 of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (2), in clause (c), for the words "two years", the words "one year" shall
be substituted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993.

Section 83 - Amendment Of Section 246

In section 246 of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1), with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993, -
(a) in clause (g), the following words, figures and letters shall be inserted at the end, namely :-
"in respect of any assessment for the assessment year commencing on or before the 1st day of April, 1992";
(b) in clause (h), the following words, figures and letters shall be inserted at the end, namely :-

"in respect of any assessment for the assessment year commencing on or before the 1st day of April, 1992".
Section 84 - Omission Of Section 247
Section 247 of the Income-tax Act shall be omitted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993.
Section 85 - Amendment Of Section 253

In section 253 of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (6), for the words "a fee of two hundred rupees", the following shall be
substituted, with effect from the 1st day of June, 1992, namely :-

"a fee of, -

(a) where the total income of the assessee as computed by the Assessing Officer in the case to which the appeal
relates is one lakh rupees or less, two hundred and fifty rupees;

(b) where the total income of the assessee computed as aforesaid in the case to which the appeal relates is more
than one lakh rupees, one thousand and five hundred rupees.".



Section 86 - Substitution Of New Section For Section 267

For section 267 of the Income-tax Act, the following section shall be substituted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993,
namely :-

"267. Amendment of assessment on appeal. - Where as a result of an appeal under section 246 or section 253, any
change is made in the assessment of a body of individuals or an association of persons or a new assessment of a body
of individuals or an association of persons is ordered to be made, the Deputy Commissioner (Appeals) or the
Commissioner (Appeals) or the Appellate Tribunal, as the case may be, shall pass an order authorising the Assessing
Officer either to amend the assessment made on any member of the body or association or make a fresh assessment on
any member of the body or association.".

Section 87 - Amendment Of The Second Schedule

In the Second Schedule to the Income-tax Act, after rule 68A, the following rule shall be inserted, with effect from the 1st
day of June, 1992, namely :-

"68B. Time-limit for sale of attached immovable property. - (1) No sale of immovable property shall be made under this
Part after the expiry of three years from the end of the financial year in which the order giving rise to a demand of any
tax, interest, fine, penalty or any other sum, for the recovery of which the immovable property has been attached, has
become conclusive under the provisions of section 245-I or, as the case may be, final in terms of the provisions of
Chapter XX :

Provided that where the immovable property is required to be resold due to the amount of highest bid being less
than the reserve price or under the circumstances mentioned in rule 57 or rule 58 or where the sale is set aside
under rule 61, the aforesaid period of limitation for the sale of the immovable property shall stand extended by one
year.

(2) In computing the period of limitation under sub-rule (1), the period -

(1) during which the levy of the aforesaid tax, interest, fine, penalty or any other sum is stayed by an order or
injunction of any court; or

(ii) during which the proceedings of attachment or sale of the immovable property are stayed by an order or
injunction of any court; or

(iii) commencing from the date of the presentation of any appeal against the order passed by the Tax Recovery
Officer under this Schedule and ending on the day the appeal is decided,

shall be excluded :
Provided that where immediately after the exclusion of the aforesaid period, the period of limitation for the sale
of the immovable fproperty is less than 180 days, such remaining period shall be extended to 180 days and the
aforesaid period of limitation shall be deemed to be extended accordingly.
(3) Where any immovable property has been attached under this Part before the 1st day of June, 1992, and the order
giving rise to a demand of any tax, interest, fine, penalty or any other sum, for the recovery of which the immovable
property has been attached, has also become conclusive or final before the said date, that date shall be deemed to be
the date on which the said order has become conclusive or, as the case may be, final.
(4) Where the sale of immovable property is not made in accordance with the provisions of sub-rule (1), the attachment

order in relation to the said property shall be deemed to have been vacated on the expiry of the time of limitation
specified under this rule.".

Section 88 - Consequential Amendments

The following amendments (being amendments of a consequential nature) shall be made in the Income-tax Act, -

(a) in section 32, in sub-section (2), the brackets and words "(or, if the assessee is a registered firm or an unregistered
firm assessed as a registered firm, in the assessment of its partners)" shall be omitted with effect from the 1st day of
April, 1993;

(b) in section 139, in sub-section (1), in the Explanation, in clause (b), in sub-clause (i), the words "or in the case of a
partner of a firm where the accounts of the firm are required to be so audited" shall be omitted with effect from the 1st
day of April, 1993;

(c) in section 143, in sub-section (1), in clause (c), with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993, -
(a) the words "a partner of a firm" shall be omitted;

(b) the word "firm", at both the places where it occurs, shall be omitted.



Section 89 - Amendment Of Section 2

In section 2 of the Wealth-tax Act, 1957 (27 of 1957) (hereinafter referred to as the Wealth-tax Act), with effect from the 1st
day of April, 1993, -

(a) in clause (e), in sub-clause (2), in the opening portion, after the words "subsequent assessment year", the words,
figures and letters "but before the 1st day of April, 1993" shall be inserted;

(b) after clause (e), the following clause shall be inserted, namely :-

'(ea) "assets", in relation to the assessment year commencing on the 1st day of April, 1993, or any subsequent
assessment year, means -

() any guest house and any residential house [including a farm house situated within twenty-five kilometres
from the local limits of any municipality (whether known as a municipality, municipal corporation, notified area
committee, town area committee, town committee or by any other name) or a cantonment board], but does not
include -

(1) a house meant exclusively for residential purposes and which is allotted by a comlpany to an employee or an
officer or a director who is in whole-time employment, having a gross annual salary of less than two lakh
rupees;

(2) any house for residential purposes which forms part of stock-in-trade;

(ii) motor cars (other than those used by the assessee in the business of running them on hire or as stock-in-
trade);

(iii) jewellery, bullion and furniture, utensils or any other article made wholly or partly of gold, silver, platinum
or any other precious metal or any alloy containing one or more of such precious metals :

Provided that where any of the said assets is used by the assessee as stock-in-trade, such asset shall be deemed as
excluded from the assets specified in this sub-clause;

(iv) yachts, boats, and aircrafts (other than those used by the assessee for commercial purposes);
(v) urban land;

(vi) cash in hand, in excess of fifty thousand rupees, of individuals and Hindu undivided families and in the case
of other persons any amount not recorded in the books of account.

Explanation : For the purposes of this clause, -

(a) "jewellery" includes -

(i) ornaments made of gold, silver, platinum or any other precious metal or any alloy containing one or more of
such precious metals, whether or not containing any precious or semi-precious stones, and whether or not
worked or sewn into any wearing apparel;

(ii) prgcious or semj—precious stones, whether or not set in any furniture, utensils or other article or worked or
sewn into any wearing apparel;

(b) "urban land" means land situate -

(i) in any area which is comprised within the jurisdiction of a municipality (whether known as a municipality,
municipal corporation, notified area committee, town area committee, town committee, or by any other name)
or a cantonment board and which has a population of not less than ten thousand according to the last preceding
census of which the relevant figures have been published before the valuation date; or

(ii)) in any area within such distance, not being more than eight kilometres from the local limits of any
municipality or cantonment board referred to in sub-clause (i), as the Central Government may, having regard to
the extent of, and scope for, urbanisation of that area and other relevant considerations, specify in this behalf by
notification in the Official Gazette,

but does not include land on which construction of a building is not permissible under any law for the time being in
force in the area in which such land is situated or the land occupied by any building which has been constructed
with the approval of the a}ﬂpropriate authority or any unused land held by the assessee for industrial purposes for a

period of two years from t

e date of its acquisition by him;';

(¢) in clause (m), for the portion beginning with the words "on the valuation date other than -" and ending with the
words, brackets, figures and letter "under sub-section (1A) of section 5;"; the words "on the valuation date which
have been incurred in relation to the said assets;" shall be substituted.

Section 90 - Amendment Of Section 3

Section 3 of the Wealth-tax Act shall be renumbered as sub-section (1) thereof and, with effect from the 1st day of April,

1993, -

(a) in sub-section (1) as so renumbered, after the words and figures "first day of April, 1957", the words and figures "but
before the first day of April, 1993" shall be inserted;



(b) after sub-section (1) as so renumbered, the following sub-section shall be inserted, namely :-

"(2) Subject to the other provisions contained in this Act, there shall be charged for every assessment year
commencing on and from the 1st day of April, 1993, wealth-tax in respect of the net wealth on the corresponding
valuation date of every individual, Hindu undivided family and company, at the rate of one per cent. of the amount
by which the net wealth exceeds fifteen lakh rupees.".

Section 91 - Amendment Of Section 4

In section 4 of the Wealth-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993, -

(a) in sub-section (1), -

() in sub-clause (ii), the words "to whom such assets have been transferred by the individual, directly or indirectly,
otherwise than for adequate consideration," shall be omitted;

(2) in sub-clause (iii), the words "or minor child (not being a married daughter) or both" shall be omitted;

(3) in sub-clause (v), the words "or the son's minor child," shall be omitted;

(4) in sub-clause (vi), the words "or the son's minor child" shall be omitted,;

(5) after the existing proviso, the following provisos shall be inserted, namely :-

"Provided further that nothing contained in sub-clause (ii) shall apply in respect of such assets as have been
acquired by the minor child out of his income referred to in the proviso to sub-section (1A) of section 64 of the
Income-tax Act and which are held by him on the valuation date :

Provided also that where the assets held by a minor child are to be included in computing the net wealth of an
individual, such assets shall be included, -

(a) where the marriage of his parents subsists, in the net wealth of that parent whose net wealth (excluding the
assets of the minor child so includible under this sub-section) is greater; or

(b) where the marriage of his parents does not subsist, in the net wealth of that parent who maintains the minor
child in the previous year as defined in section 3 of the Income-tax Act,

and where any such assets are once included in the net wealth of either parent, any such assets shall not be
included in the net wealth of the other parent in any succeeding year unless the Assessing Officer is satisfied, after
giving that parent an opportunity of being heard, that it is necessary so to do.";

(ii) in clause (b), -

(1) in the opening portion, for the words "interest in the firm", the words "interest in the assets of the firm" shall
be substituted;

(2) for the proviso, the following proviso shall be substituted, namely :-
"Provided that where a minor is admitted to the benefits of partnership in a firm, the value of the interest of

such minor in the firm, determined in the manner specified above, shall be included in the net wealth of the
parent of the minor, so far as may be, in accordance with the provisions of the third proviso to clause (a).";

](Jb) in subasection (14), in clause (c) and the proviso thereunder, the words "or minor child", wherever they occur, shall
e omitted;

(c) sub-section (3) shall be omitted.

Section 92 - Amendment Of Section 5

In section 5 of the Wealth-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993, -

(a) in sub-section (1), -

(1) the brackets, figures, words and letter "(1) subject to the provisions of sub-section (1A),", occurring in the opening
portion, shall be omitted;

(ii) clause (xiv) and (xxxiii) shall be renumbered as clauses (iv) and (v) and the existing clause (iv) to (xiii), clauses
(xv) to (xxxii) and clause (xxxiv) shall be omitted;

(b) sub-sections (1A) to (4) shall be omitted.

Section 93 - Amendment Of Section 7

In section 7 of the Wealth-tax Act, in sub-section (2), the proviso shall be omitted with effect from the 1st day of April,

1993.



Section 94 - Amendment Of Section 21

In section 21 of the Wealth-tax Act, after sub-section (5), and the Explanation thereunder, the following sub-section shall
be inserted, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993, namely :-

"(6) Nothing contained in this section shall apply to and in relation to any assessment for the assessment year
commencing on the 1st day of April, 1993, or any subsequent assessment year.".

Section 95 - Amendment Of Section 21A

In section 21A of the Wealth-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993, -

(a) for the words, brackets and figures "Notwithstanding anything contained in clause (i) of sub-section (1) of section 5,
where any property is held", the words "Where any property is held" shall be substituted;

(b) the words, brackets and figures "but without excluding the value of any asset under sub-section (1) of section 5, and
at the maximum marginal rate" shall be omitted;

(c) the second proviso shall be omitted;
(d) in the third proviso, -
(i) for the words "Provided also that", the words "Provided further that" shall be substituted;

(ii) in item (2), for the words and figures "Part I of Schedule I in the case of an individual", the words, brackets and
figures "sub-section (2) of section 3" shall be substituted;

(e) in the Explanation, clause (aa) shall be omitted.
Section 96 - Amendment Of Section 21AA

In section 21AA of the Wealth-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993, -
(a) in sub-section (1), the words, "and at the maximum marginal rate", occurring at the end, shall be omitted;

(b) the Explanation shall be omitted.
Section 97 - Amendment Of Section 35

In section 35 of the Wealth-tax Act, in sub-section (2), after the words, brackets and letter "clause (m) of section 2", the
words and figures", as it existed immediately before its amendment by the Finance Act, 1992," shall be inserted with effect
from the 1st day of April, 1993.

Section 98 - Insertion Of New Section 35HA

After section 35H of the Wealth-tax Act, the following section shall be inserted, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993,
namely :-

'35HA. Offences by companies. - (1) Where an offence under this Act has been committed by a company, every person
who, at the time the offence was committed, was in charge of, and was responsible to, the company for the conduct of
the business of the company as well as the company shall be deemed to be guilty of the offence and shall be liable to be
proceeded against and punished accordingly :

Provided that nothing contained in this sub-section shall render any such person liable to any punishment if he
proves that the offence was committed without his knowledge or that he had exercised all due diligence to prevent

the commission of such offence.
(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1), where an offence under this Act has been committed by a
company and it is proved that the offence has been committed with the consent or connivance of, or is attributable to
any neglect on the part of, any director, manager, secretary or other officer of the company, such director, manager,

secretary or other officer shall be deemed to be guilty of that offence and shall be liable to be proceeded against and
punished accordingly.

Explanation : For the purposes of this section, -

(a) "company" means a body corporate, and includes -



@) a firm; and

(ii) an association of persons or a body of individuals whether incorporated or not; and
(b) "director", in relation to, -

(i) a firm, means a partner in a firm;

(ii) any association of persons or a body of individuals, means any member controlling the affairs thereof.".

Section 99 - Amendment Of Section 45

In section 45 of the Wealth-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993, -
(a) clauses (a) to (e) shall be omitted,;
(b) for clause (h), the following clause shall be substituted, namely :-

"(h) any social club;".
Section 100 - Amendment Of Schedule I

In Schedule I of the Wealth-tax Act, with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993, -

(a) for the brackets, words and figure "(See section 3)", the brackets, words and figures "[See section 3(1)]" shall be
substituted;

(b) Part II shall be omitted;

(c) rules 1, 3, 4 and 5 shall be omitted.
Section 101 - Omission Of Schedule II
Schedule II of the Wealth-tax Act shall be omitted with effect from 1st day of April, 1993.
Section 102 - Amendment Of Schedule III
In Schedule III of the Wealth-tax Act, Part C shall be omitted with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993.
Section 103 - Amendment Of Section 2

In section 2 of the Interest-tax Act, 1974 (45 of 1974), with effect from the 1st day of April, 1993, -

(1) in clause (5A), in sub-clause (i), the words "or a co-operative society engaged in carrying on the business of banking
not being a co-operative society providing credit facilities to farmers or village artisans” shall be omitted;

(>ii) in clause (5B), -
(a) in sub-clause (v), the word "or", occurring at the end, shall be omitted;
(b) after sub-clause (v), the following sub-clause shall be inserted, namely :-

"(va) a residuary non-banking company [other than a financial company referred to in sub-clause (i), (ii), (iii),
(iv) or (v)], that is to say, a company which receives any deposit under any scheme or arrangement, by whatever
name called, in one lump sum or in instalments by way of contributions or subscriptions or by sale of units or
certificates or other instruments or in any other manner; or",

Section 104 - Amendment Of Section 5
In section 5 of the Interest-tax Act, 1974 (45 of 1974), after the words "advances made to other credit institutions", the
words "or to any co-operative society engaged in carrying on the business of banking" shall be inserted with effect from
the 1st day of October, 1991.

Section 105 - Amendment Of Section 3

In the Expenditure-tax Act, 1987 (35 of 1987) (hereinafter referred to as the Expenditure-tax Act), in section 3, with effect



from the 1st day of June, 1992, -

(@) in clause (1), for the words "four hundred rupees”, the words "one thousand two hundred rupees" shall be
substituted;

(b) in clause (2), the words, figures and letters "before the 1st day of June, 1992" shall be inserted at the end.
Section 106 - Amendment Of Section 4

In the Expenditure-tax Act, in section 4, in clause (b), after the words, letters and figures "the 1st day of October, 1991", the
words, figures and letters "but not after the 31st day of May, 1992" shall be inserted with effect from the 1st day of June,
1992.

Section 107 - Amendment Of Section 5

In the Expenditure-tax Act, in section 5, in clause (1), in sub-clause (i), the words, figures and letters "before the 1st day of
October, 1992" shall be inserted at the end with effect from the 1st day of June, 1992.

Section 108 - Amendment Of Section 7

In the Expenditure-tax Act, in section 7, in sub-section (2), after the word and figure "section 3", the words, figures and
letters "before the 1st day of June, 1992" shall be inserted with effect from the 1st day of June, 1992.




